

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid Result

BID NO:	RFP 17/34
SUBJECT:	Musical Instruments
DATE:	7/26/2016
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Fine Arts
AWARDED TO:	Highlighted in Green Below

Vendors	Total Selmer	Total Yamaha	Total Cerveny	Total Conn	Total Carlo Lamberti
Taylor Music Aberdeen, SD	\$1,428.00	\$93,373.00	No Bid	\$5,535.00	No Bid
Washington Music Center Wheaton, MD	\$1,428.00	\$93,479.00	No Bid	\$5,620.00	No Bid
Midwest Musical Imports Minneapolis, MN	\$1,450.00	\$92,627.00	No Bid	\$5,630.00	No Bid
Cascio Interstate Music, Inc. New Berlin, WI	\$1,432.90	\$93,628.30	\$4,293.90	\$5,604.90	Provided Sub
Shar Products Company Ann Arbor, MI	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12,447.00
Sam Ash Quickship Corpotation Tampa, FL	\$1,438.00	\$93,896.00	No Bid	\$5,655.00	No Bid
National Educational Music Co. Mountainside, NJ	\$1,480.28	\$93,573.67	\$4,636.92	\$5,826.04	No Bid
Universal Melody Services Dallas, TX	\$1,497.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,895.00	No Bid
Nick Rail Music Santa Barbara, CA	\$1,520.00	\$103,330.00	No Bid	\$5,969.00	No Bid
Mozingo Music Ellisville, MO	\$1,529.00	\$101,811.00	No Bid	\$6,015.00	No Bid
Band Instrument Service St. Charles, MO	\$1,540.00	\$95,570.00	No Bid	\$6,075.00	No Bid
Melhart Music Center McAllen, TX	\$1,545.00	\$97,816.00	No Bid	\$6,077.00	No Bid
Palen Music Center Columbia, MO	\$1,608.48	\$102,268.80	No Bid	\$6,330.63	No Bid
Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc Westlake Village, CA	\$1,627.00	\$102,316.00	\$5,050.00	\$6,380.00	No Bid
Dillon Music Woodbridge, NJ	\$1,670.00	\$105,520.00	\$5,420.00	\$6,400.00	No Bid
Northeast Music, Inc Latham, NY	\$1,929.00	\$105,709.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Hickey's Music Center Ithaca, NY	\$1,989.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,900.00	No Bid
K&S Music* Berkeley Heights, NJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Provided Sub

* Did not sign bid form