

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	Nasco, Fort Atkinson, WI		National Art & School Supplies, Rahway, NJ		Discount School Supply, Monterey, CA		Blick Art Marterials Galesburg, IL		School Specialty, Lancaster, PA		S&S Worldwide Colchester, CT		
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	
131	Assorted	4	pkgs			\$ -		\$ -		\$ 9.97	\$ 39.88	\$ 5.33	\$ 21.32		\$ -	
132	White	8	pkgs		\$ -		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 13.75	\$ 110.00	\$ 3.81	\$ 30.48		\$ -	
	WATERCOLOR PAPER, ARCHES BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 22" X 30", White each:														\$ -	
133	Cold Press	6	each		\$ -		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 43.10	\$ 258.60	\$ 44.29	\$ 265.74		\$ -	
134	Hot Press	45	each		\$ -		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 4.31	\$ 193.95	\$ 4.43	\$ 199.35		\$ -	
	WATERCOLOR PAPER, MONTVAL, CANSON BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, Student Grade, Cold Press, White, 90lb, 12" x 18", 15/pkg	77	pkgs				\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.15	\$ 242.55	\$ 4.43	\$ 341.11		\$ -	
	WHITE DRAWING PAPER, in the following sizes, weights, and types														\$ -	
136	12" x 18", 60lb., sulphite	42	reams				\$ -		\$ -	\$ 19.17	\$ 805.14	\$ 10.99	\$ 461.58		\$ -	
137	12" x 18", 80lb., sulphite	111	reams				\$ -		\$ -	\$ 22.01	\$ 2,443.11	\$ 14.29	\$ 1,586.19		\$ -	
	WHITE TAG BOARD, 12" x 18", 150lb, 100 shts/pkg	53	pkgs				\$ -		\$ -	\$ 8.83	\$ 467.99	\$ 4.73	\$ 250.69		\$ -	
	Item#:														\$ -	
TOTAL GROUP #1					Did not bid all items		NO BID		Did not bid all items		\$ 10,575.60		\$ 6,936.21		did not bid all items	\$ -
GROUP #2																
200	GLUE, ELMER'S BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, Art Paste (Paper Mache), 2oz.	46	each		\$ -	\$ 2.10	\$ 96.60		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 2.05	\$ 94.30		\$ -	
201	GLUE, ELMER'S BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, Elmer's Glue All, 8oz. squeeze bottles	490	each		\$ -	\$ 1.70	\$ 833.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 1.65	\$ 808.50		\$ -	
202	PENCIL SHARPENER, Xacto By Boston, NO SUBSTITUTES, High Volume Commercial (1606) Model 41 each	3	each		\$ -	\$ 97.80	\$ 293.40		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 101.95	\$ 305.85		\$ -	
203	ERASER, DESIGN KNEADED BRAND MEDIUM, NO SUBSTITUTES, 1-1/4"x3/4"x1/4", 24/box	33	boxes		\$ -	\$ 7.20	\$ 237.60		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 8.08	\$ 266.64		\$ -	
204	ERASER, PINK PEARL BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, Medium, 24/box	61	boxes		\$ -	\$ 5.60	\$ 341.60		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 6.37	\$ 388.57		\$ -	
205	ERASER, WHITE PEARL BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, Medium, 12/box, Latex free	47	boxes		\$ -	\$ 5.00	\$ 235.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 4.95	\$ 232.65		\$ -	
206	MASKING TAPE, SCOTCH BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 60 Yard Roll 3" Core 1" wide	159	Yard		\$ -	\$ 4.90	\$ 779.10		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 4.90	\$ 779.10		\$ -	
207	ANTIMICROBIAL WOOD PENCIL, DIXON TICONDEROGA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, #2 Lead, Latex free eraser, 12/box	258	boxes		\$ -	\$ 1.70	\$ 438.60		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 1.65	\$ 425.70		\$ -	
208	UNIBALL BRAND ONYX PEN, NO SUBSTITUTES, Fine Point Black, 12/Box	73	boxes		\$ -	\$ 3.72	\$ 271.56		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.33	\$ 389.09		\$ -	

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	Nasco, Fort Atkinson, WI		National Art & School Supplies, Rahway, NJ		Discount School Supply, Monterey, CA		Blick Art Marterials Galesburg, IL		School Specialty, Lancaster, PA		S&S Worldwide Colchester, CT	
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
209	GAUZE BANDAGES, PLASTICRAFT, NO SUBSTITUTES, 20 lb. package	10	Pkg		\$ -	\$ 50.00	\$ 500.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 49.95	\$ 499.50		\$ -
	SCISSORS, FISKARS BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, metal blade in the following sizes:														
210	Kids, 5", Blunt #9416	36	each		\$ -	\$ 1.40	\$ 50.40		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 1.35	\$ 48.60		\$ -
211	Students, 7" #9458	76	each		\$ -	\$ 2.10	\$ 159.60		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 2.20	\$ 167.20		\$ -
	PERMANENT MARKERS, SHARPIE BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES in the following tips/points, colors, and amounts:														
212	Fine tip/point, 8 color set	85	set		\$ -	\$ 3.80	\$ 323.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 4.50	\$ 382.50		\$ -
213	Fine tip/point, black, 12/pkg	202	pkgs		\$ -	\$ 5.25	\$ 1,060.50		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 6.86	\$ 1,385.72		\$ -
214	Extra fine tip/point, black 12/pkg	175	pkgs		\$ -	\$ 5.25	\$ 918.75		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 6.86	\$ 1,200.50		\$ -
215	Fine tip/point, gold 12/pkg	17	pkgs		\$ -	\$ 12.90	\$ 219.30		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 15.88	\$ 269.96		\$ -
216	Fine tip/point, silver 12/pkg	23	pkgs		\$ -	\$ 9.60	\$ 220.80		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 10.53	\$ 242.19		\$ -
TOTAL GROUP #2:						did not bid all items	\$ -	\$ 6,978.81	did not bid all items	\$ -	No Bid		\$ 7,886.57	did not bid all items	\$ -
GROUP #3															
300	CRAYONS, CRAYOLA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, Classpack, 64 colors of 832 Crayons, 13 Bins, 2 Sharpeners	7	pack	\$ 43.99	\$ 307.93	\$ 44.00	\$ 308.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 43.00	\$ 301.00		\$ -
301	CONSTRUCTION PAPER CRAYONS, CRAYOLA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, Classpack, 160 count	4	pack	\$ 27.90	\$ 111.60	\$ 27.50	\$ 110.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 27.95	\$ 111.80		\$ -
302	MULTICULTURAL CRAYONS, CRAYOLA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 8 colors/box	65	boxes	\$ 0.52	\$ 33.80	\$ 0.50	\$ 32.50		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 0.52	\$ 33.80		\$ -
303	CLASSIC COLOR WASHABLE MARKERS, CRAYOLA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, in the following sets/packs listed: 8 color set	12	sets	\$ 2.48	\$ 29.76	\$ 1.80	\$ 21.60		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 2.45	\$ 29.40		\$ -
304	Classpack, 16 markers of 16 colors, 256/pkg	16	pkgs	\$ 50.70	\$ 811.20	\$ 46.20	\$ 739.20		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 50.00	\$ 800.00		\$ -
305	OIL PASTELS, CRAYOLA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 28 colors/box	40	boxes	\$ 2.58	\$ 103.20	\$ 2.50	\$ 100.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 2.55	\$ 102.00		\$ -
306	OIL PASTELS, CRAYOLA BRAND, PORTFOLIO SERIES, NO SUBSTITUTES, 24 colors/set 24 Color/set	39	sets	\$ 5.24	\$ 204.36	\$ 5.30	\$ 206.70		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.25	\$ 204.75		\$ -
307	COLOR PENCILS, CRAYOLA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES in the following boxes/packs listed: 24/box, long, easel box	63	boxes	\$ 2.75	\$ 173.25	\$ 2.50	\$ 157.50		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 2.78	\$ 175.14		\$ -
308	Classpack, 20 pencils of 12 colors, 240/pkg	5	pkgs	\$ 27.96	\$ 139.80	\$ 28.00	\$ 140.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 27.95	\$ 139.75		\$ -
309	MULTICULTURAL COLOR PENCILS, CRAYOLA BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 8 color/box	36	boxes	\$ 1.20	\$ 43.20	\$ 1.30	\$ 46.80		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 1.17	\$ 42.12		\$ -
310	ACRYLIC PAINT, CRAYOLA BRAND, PORTFOLIO SERIES, NO SUBSTITUTES, pint containers, in the following colors: Brilliant Orange	10	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 55.90	\$ 6.00	\$ 60.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 59.50		\$ -
311	Brilliant Yellow	14	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 78.26	\$ 6.00	\$ 84.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 83.30		\$ -
312	Burnt Umber	8	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 44.72	\$ 6.00	\$ 48.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 47.60		\$ -
313	Deep Red	17	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 95.03	\$ 6.00	\$ 102.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 101.15		\$ -
314	Ivory Black	21	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 117.39	\$ 6.00	\$ 126.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 124.95		\$ -
315	Phthalo Blue	16	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 89.44	\$ 6.00	\$ 96.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 95.20		\$ -
316	Phthalo Green	7	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 39.13	\$ 6.00	\$ 42.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 41.65		\$ -
317	Titanium White	26	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 145.34	\$ 6.00	\$ 156.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 154.70		\$ -

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	Nasco, Fort Atkinson, WI		National Art & School Supplies, Rahway, NJ		Discount School Supply, Monterey, CA		Blick Art Marterials Galesburg, IL		School Specialty, Lancaster, PA		S&S Worldwide Colchester, CT	
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
318	Violet	15	pint	\$ 5.59	\$ 83.85	\$ 6.00	\$ 90.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 5.95	\$ 89.25		\$ -
	LIQUID TEMPERA PAINT, CRAYOLA ARTISTA II BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, quart containers, in the following colors:				\$ -						\$ -				
319	Black	42	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 169.68	\$ 3.70	\$ 155.40		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 157.50		\$ -
320	Blue	60	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 242.40	\$ 3.70	\$ 222.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 225.00		\$ -
321	Brown	26	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 105.04	\$ 3.70	\$ 96.20		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 97.50		\$ -
322	Green	31	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 125.24	\$ 3.70	\$ 114.70		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 116.25		\$ -
323	Magenta	24	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 96.96	\$ 3.70	\$ 88.80		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 90.00		\$ -
324	Orange	30	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 121.20	\$ 3.70	\$ 111.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 112.50		\$ -
325	Peach	4	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 16.16	\$ 3.70	\$ 14.80		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 15.00		\$ -
326	Red	70	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 282.80	\$ 3.70	\$ 259.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 262.50		\$ -
327	Turquoise	44	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 177.76	\$ 3.70	\$ 162.80		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 165.00		\$ -
328	Violet	28	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 113.12	\$ 3.70	\$ 103.60		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 105.00		\$ -
329	White	81	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 327.24	\$ 3.70	\$ 299.70		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 303.75		\$ -
330	Yellow	70	quarts	\$ 4.04	\$ 282.80	\$ 3.70	\$ 259.00		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 3.75	\$ 262.50		\$ -
	LIQUID TEMPERA PAINT, CRAYOLA PREMIER BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, pint containers, in the following colors:														
331	Gold	16	pints	\$ 6.58	\$ 105.28	\$ 6.40	\$ 102.40		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 6.55	\$ 104.80		\$ -
332	Silver	16	pints	\$ 6.58	\$ 105.28	\$ 6.40	\$ 102.40		\$ -		\$ -	\$ 6.55	\$ 104.80		\$ -
TOTAL GROUP #3:					\$ 4,978.12	\$ 4,758.10		NO BID	\$ -		NO BID	\$ 4,859.16		NO BID	\$ -
GROUP #4															
400	PENCIL SHARPENER, PRISMACOLOR COLORED PENCIL, OVAL	61	each	\$ 1.02	\$ 62.22	\$ 1.20	\$ 73.20		\$ -	\$ 1.46	\$ 89.06	\$ 1.05	\$ 64.05		\$ -
401	PENCIL, PRISMACOLOR PREMIER SANFORD BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, COLORLESS BLENDER 12/box	9	boxes	\$ 10.39	\$ 93.51	\$ 9.60	\$ 86.40		\$ -	\$ 7.56	\$ 68.04	\$ 10.44	\$ 93.96		\$ -
402	EBONY BLACK PENCIL, DESIGN BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 12/pkg	18	pkg	\$ 4.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 3.60	\$ 64.80		\$ -	\$ 4.86	\$ 87.48	\$ 4.07	\$ 73.26		\$ -
403	PRISMACOLOR ART STICKS, SANFORD BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 24 colors/set	37	set	\$ 21.80	\$ 806.60	\$ 24.00	\$ 888.00		\$ -	\$ 26.04	\$ 963.48	\$ 21.92	\$ 811.04		\$ -
404	PRISMACOLOR MARKERS, SANFORD BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 24 set	7	set	\$ 57.60	\$ 403.20	\$ 56.00	\$ 392.00		\$ -	\$ 32.48	\$ 227.36	\$ 57.65	\$ 403.55		\$ -
405	PRISMACOLOR PENCILS, SANFORD BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 24 color/set	55	set	\$ 20.50	\$ 1,127.50	\$ 17.80	\$ 979.00		\$ -	\$ 12.43	\$ 683.65	\$ 20.58	\$ 1,131.90		\$ -
	PRISMACOLOR PENCILS, SANFORD BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES in the following colors:								\$ -						
406	Apple Green 912	22	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 18.70	\$ 0.80	\$ 17.60		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 13.86	\$ 0.86	\$ 18.92		\$ -
407	Aquamarine 905	15	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 12.75	\$ 0.80	\$ 12.00		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 9.45	\$ 0.86	\$ 12.90		\$ -
408	Black 935	195	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 165.75	\$ 0.80	\$ 156.00		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 122.85	\$ 0.86	\$ 167.70		\$ -
409	Canary Yellow 916	96	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 81.60	\$ 0.80	\$ 76.80		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 60.48	\$ 0.86	\$ 82.56		\$ -
410	Cool Grey 30% 1061	10	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 8.50	\$ 0.80	\$ 8.00		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 6.30	\$ 0.86	\$ 8.60		\$ -
411	Cool Grey 50% 1063	45	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 38.25	\$ 0.80	\$ 36.00		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 28.35	\$ 0.86	\$ 38.70		\$ -
412	Cream 914	28	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 23.80	\$ 0.80	\$ 22.40		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 17.64	\$ 0.86	\$ 24.08		\$ -
413	Crimson Red 924	106	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 90.10	\$ 0.80	\$ 84.80		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 66.78	\$ 0.86	\$ 91.16		\$ -
414	Dark Brown 946	5	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 4.25	\$ 0.80	\$ 4.00		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 3.15	\$ 0.86	\$ 4.30		\$ -
415	Dark Green 908	17	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 14.45	\$ 0.80	\$ 13.60		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 10.71	\$ 0.86	\$ 14.62		\$ -
416	Gold 950	153	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 130.05	\$ 0.80	\$ 122.40		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 96.39	\$ 0.86	\$ 131.58		\$ -
417	Grass Green 909	88	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 74.80	\$ 0.80	\$ 70.40		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 55.44	\$ 0.86	\$ 75.68		\$ -
418	Indigo Blue 901	59	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 50.15	\$ 0.80	\$ 47.20		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 37.17	\$ 0.86	\$ 50.74		\$ -
419	Light Cerulean Blue 904	75	Each	\$ 0.85	\$ 63.75	\$ 0.80	\$ 60.00		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 47.25	\$ 0.86	\$ 64.50		\$ -
420	Mulberry 995	33	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 28.05	\$ 0.80	\$ 26.40		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 20.79	\$ 0.86	\$ 28.38		\$ -
421	Orange 918	54	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 45.90	\$ 0.80	\$ 43.20		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 34.02	\$ 0.86	\$ 46.44		\$ -
422	Parma Violet 1008	17	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 14.45	\$ 0.80	\$ 13.60		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 10.71	\$ 0.86	\$ 14.62		\$ -
423	Peach 939	33	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 28.05	\$ 0.80	\$ 26.40		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 20.79	\$ 0.86	\$ 28.38		\$ -
424	Pink 929	51	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 43.35	\$ 0.80	\$ 40.80		\$ -	\$ 0.63	\$ 32.13	\$ 0.86	\$ 43.86		\$ -

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	Nasco, Fort Atkinson, WI		National Art & School Supplies, Rahway, NJ		Discount School Supply, Monterey, CA		Blick Art Marterials Galesburg, IL		School Specialty, Lancaster, PA		S&S Worldwide Colchester, CT	
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
425	Poppy Red 922	59	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 50.15	\$ 0.80	\$ 47.20			\$ 0.63	\$ 37.17	\$ 0.86	\$ 50.74		\$ -
426	Scarlet Lake 923	5	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 4.25	\$ 0.80	\$ 4.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 3.15	\$ 0.86	\$ 4.30		\$ -
427	Sienna Brown 945	15	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 12.75	\$ 0.80	\$ 12.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 9.45	\$ 0.86	\$ 12.90		\$ -
428	Silver 949	74	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 62.90	\$ 0.80	\$ 59.20			\$ 0.63	\$ 46.62	\$ 0.86	\$ 63.64		\$ -
429	Spring Green 913	5	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 4.25	\$ 0.80	\$ 4.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 3.15	\$ 0.86	\$ 4.30		\$ -
430	True Blue 903	59	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 50.15	\$ 0.80	\$ 47.20			\$ 0.63	\$ 37.17	\$ 0.86	\$ 50.74		\$ -
431	True Green 910	47	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 39.95	\$ 0.80	\$ 37.60			\$ 0.63	\$ 29.61	\$ 0.86	\$ 40.42		\$ -
432	Tuscan Red 937	40	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 34.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 32.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 25.20	\$ 0.86	\$ 34.40		\$ -
433	Ultramarine Blue 902	45	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 38.25	\$ 0.80	\$ 36.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 28.35	\$ 0.86	\$ 38.70		\$ -
434	Violet 932	44	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 37.40	\$ 0.80	\$ 35.20			\$ 0.63	\$ 27.72	\$ 0.86	\$ 37.84		\$ -
435	Violet Blue 933	40	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 34.00	\$ 0.80	\$ 32.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 25.20	\$ 0.86	\$ 34.40		\$ -
436	Warm Grey 30% 1052	15	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 12.75	\$ 0.80	\$ 12.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 9.45	\$ 0.86	\$ 12.90		\$ -
437	White 938	210	each	\$ 0.85	\$ 178.50	\$ 0.80	\$ 168.00			\$ 0.63	\$ 132.30	\$ 0.86	\$ 180.60		\$ -
						\$ -				\$ -					\$ -
	TURQUOISE DRAWING PENCIL, SANFORD BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES					\$ -				\$ -					\$ -
438	B	11	each	\$ 2.89	\$ 31.79	\$ 7.32	\$ 80.52			\$ 4.20	\$ 46.20	\$ 2.55	\$ 28.05		\$ -
439	HB	22	each	\$ 2.89	\$ 63.58	\$ 7.32	\$ 161.04			\$ 4.20	\$ 92.40	\$ 2.55	\$ 56.10		\$ -
440	2B	33	each	\$ 2.89	\$ 95.37	\$ 7.32	\$ 241.56			\$ 4.20	\$ 138.60	\$ 2.55	\$ 84.15		\$ -
441	4B	22	each	\$ 2.89	\$ 63.58	\$ 7.32	\$ 161.04			\$ 4.20	\$ 92.40	\$ 2.55	\$ 56.10		\$ -
442	6B	15	each	\$ 2.89	\$ 43.35	\$ 7.32	\$ 109.80			\$ 4.20	\$ 63.00	\$ 2.55	\$ 38.25		\$ -
443	2H	20	each	\$ 2.89	\$ 57.80	\$ 7.32	\$ 146.40			\$ 4.20	\$ 84.00	\$ 2.55	\$ 51.00		\$ -
444	4H	13	each	\$ 2.89	\$ 37.57	\$ 7.32	\$ 95.16			\$ 4.20	\$ 54.60	\$ 2.55	\$ 33.15		\$ -
					\$ -		\$ -								\$ -
TOTAL GROUP #4					\$ 4,454.07		\$ 4,886.92	No Bid		Did not bid specified brand			\$ 4,438.16	NO BID	\$ -
GROUP #5															
500	WATERCOLOR PAINT, OVAL, PRANG BRAND, 8 color set	246	pkg	\$ 2.32	\$ 570.72		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 2.13	\$ 523.98		\$ -
501	WATERCOLOR PAINT, OVAL, PRANG BRAND, 16 color set	92	pkg	\$ 4.39	\$ 403.88		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 4.71	\$ 433.32		\$ -
	WATERCOLOR PAINT, PRANG BRAND, Individual oval refill colors, 12/pkg, in the following colors:														
502	Black	17	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 55.25		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 55.93		\$ -
503	Blue	32	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 104.00		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 105.28		\$ -
504	Blue-Green	2	pkg	\$ 3.02	\$ 6.04		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 6.58		\$ -
505	Blue-Violet	3	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 9.75		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 9.87		\$ -
506	Brown	10	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 32.50		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 32.90		\$ -
507	Green	18	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 58.50		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 59.22		\$ -
508	Orange	20	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 65.00		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 65.80		\$ -
509	Red	29	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 94.25		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 95.41		\$ -
510	Red-Orange	1	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 3.25		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 3.29		\$ -
511	Red-Violet	4	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 13.00		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 13.16		\$ -
512	Turquoise	15	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 48.75		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 49.35		\$ -
513	Violet	11	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 35.75		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 36.19		\$ -
514	White	20	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 65.00		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 65.80		\$ -
515	Yellow	31	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 100.75		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 101.99		\$ -
516	Yellow-Green	4	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 13.00		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 13.16		\$ -
517	Yellow-Orange	4	pkg	\$ 3.25	\$ 13.00		\$ -				\$ -	\$ 3.29	\$ 13.16		\$ -
						\$ -									\$ -
TOTAL GROUP #5					\$ 1,692.39	No BID		Did not bid all items			NO BID		\$ 1,684.39	NO BID	\$ -
GROUP #6															
	WATERBASED BLOCK PRINTING INK, SPEEDBALL BRAND, NO SUBSTITUTES, 2.5 Oz Tube, in the following colors:														
600	Black	33	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 96.36		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 92.73	\$ 2.93	\$ 96.69		\$ -
601	Blue	10	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 29.20		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 28.10	\$ 2.93	\$ 29.30		\$ -
602	Brown	0	each	\$ 2.92	\$ -		\$ -				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -		\$ -
603	Green	3	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 8.76		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 8.43	\$ 2.93	\$ 8.79		\$ -
604	Gold	6	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 17.52		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 16.86	\$ 2.93	\$ 17.58		\$ -
605	Magenta	5	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 14.60		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 14.05	\$ 2.93	\$ 14.65		\$ -
606	Orange	2	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 5.84		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 5.62	\$ 2.93	\$ 5.86		\$ -
607	Red	5	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 14.60		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 14.05	\$ 2.93	\$ 14.65		\$ -
608	Silver	6	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 17.52		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 16.86	\$ 2.93	\$ 17.58		\$ -
609	Turquoise	4	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 11.68		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 11.24	\$ 2.93	\$ 11.72		\$ -
610	Violet	4	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 11.68		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 11.24	\$ 2.93	\$ 11.72		\$ -
611	White	4	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 11.68		\$ -			\$ 2.81	\$ 11.24	\$ 2.93	\$ 11.72		\$ -

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT	Nasco, Fort Atkinson, WI		National Art & School Supplies, Rahway, NJ		Discount School Supply, Monterey, CA		Blick Art Marterials Galesburg, IL		School Specialty, Lancaster, PA		S&S Worldwide Colchester, CT		
				UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	
612	Yellow	4	each	\$ 2.92	\$ 11.68					\$ 2.81	\$ 11.24	\$ 2.93	\$ 11.72		\$ -	
TOTAL GROUP #6					\$ 251.12	NO BID		No Bid		did not bid specified brand		\$ 251.98	NO BID		\$ -	
GROUP #7															\$ -	
	RED FIBER PORTFOLIOS w/VELCRO BRAND, fasteners, NO SUBSTITUTES:														\$ -	
700	20" X 14" X 2"	55	each	\$ 2.56	No velcro			\$ -		\$ -	\$ 2.60	\$ 143.00		\$ -		
701	31" x 23" x 2"	10	each	\$ 4.75	No velcro			\$ -		\$ -	\$ 4.78	\$ 47.80		\$ -		
702	MULTICOLOR SCRATCH-ART PAPER, NO SUBSTITUTES, 8 1/2" X 11", 50/Pkg	18	pkgs	\$ 13.33	\$ 239.94			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 13.74	\$ 247.32	\$ 15.86	\$ 285.48		
TOTAL GROUP #7 AWARD BY ITEM						NO BID		No bid							\$ -	
GROUP #8															\$ -	
800	BLENDING TORTILLION (SMALL) 1/4" x 2-7/8, 12/BOX	35	boxes	\$ 0.68	\$ 23.80			\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.55	\$ 19.25	\$ 0.70	\$ 24.50		\$ -	
801	BOXWOOD CLAY TOOLS, 6" long, 10/set	15	sets	\$ 3.33	\$ 49.95			\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3.69	\$ 55.35	\$ 3.35	\$ 50.25		\$ -	
802	CELLULOSE SPONGES, Approx. 6" x 3 1/2" x 1", each	211	each	\$ 0.66	\$ 139.26	\$ 1.30	\$ 274.30	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1.39	\$ 293.29	\$ 0.76	\$ 160.36		\$ -	
803	MODELING CLAY, 4 stick, 1lb. Assorted Colors	90	boxes	\$ 1.51	\$ 135.90			\$ -	\$ 20.79	\$ 1,871.10	\$ -	\$ 0.80	\$ 72.00	\$ 1.63	\$ 146.70	
804	Gray only	30	boxes	\$ 1.51	\$ 45.30			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 0.80	\$ 24.00	\$ 1.63	\$ 48.90	
805	FEATHER FLUFFS, Assorted colors, Approx. 130 pieces per bag, 1/2 oz size	14	bags	\$ 0.76	\$ 10.64			\$ -	\$ 1.83	\$ 25.62	\$ 1.23	\$ 17.22	\$ 0.74	\$ 10.36	\$ 0.78	\$ 10.92
806	NEEDLES, 6" Plastic, Blunt, 10 - 12/Pkg	6	pkgs	\$ 1.07	\$ 6.42			\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2.32	\$ 13.92	\$ 1.46	\$ 8.76		\$ -	
807	PAPER PLATES, White, 9" Diameter, 100/pkg	101	pkgs	\$ 2.05	\$ 207.05			\$ -	\$ 6.39	\$ 645.39	\$ -	\$ 1.69	\$ 170.69		\$ -	
808	PIPE CLEANERS, Assorted colors, 12" long, 100/pkg	87	pkgs	\$ 1.06	\$ 92.22			\$ -	\$ 15.75	\$ 1,370.25	\$ -	\$ 0.70	\$ 60.90	\$ 0.71	\$ 61.77	
809	PLASTIC BEADS, Assorted, 1 lb pkg	32	pkgs	\$ 2.46	\$ 78.72			\$ -	\$ 5.59	\$ 178.88	\$ -	\$ 2.42	\$ 77.44	\$ 2.43	\$ 77.76	
810	SOLID COLOR FEATHERS, Assorted, 12" long, 100/pkg	3	pkgs		\$ -			\$ -	5.11*	Only 24 per pack	\$ -	\$ 9.58	\$ 28.74	\$ 8.96	\$ 26.88	
811	STUBBY BRUSH SET (ROUND BRISTLE ONLY) - Red, Yellow, Blue, Green, Orange, Purple, Turquoise, White, Black, Brown - Handle 7" long, set of 10, 1 of each color	10	sets	\$ 3.95	\$ 39.50			\$ -	\$ 7.19	\$ 71.90	\$ -	\$ 1.83	\$ 18.30		\$ -	
812	WIGGLE EYES, Assorted, black on white, 100/pkg	77	pkgs	\$ 0.54	\$ 41.58			\$ -	\$ 2.31	\$ 177.87	\$ -	\$ 0.57	\$ 43.89	\$ 0.54	\$ 41.58	
813	WOOD CRAFT STICKS, 4-1/2" X 3/8", 1000/pkg	26	pkgs	\$ 3.44	\$ 89.44			\$ -	\$ 6.95	\$ 180.70	\$ -	\$ 3.01	\$ 78.26	\$ 3.45	\$ 89.70	
TOTAL GROUP #8 (AWARD BY ITEM)															\$ -	
Total to Award					\$ 721.85		\$ 11,736.91		\$ -		\$ 19.25		\$ 13,770.27		\$ 26.88	