

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result

BID NO:	RFQ 18/81
SUBJECT:	Miscellaneous Classroom Furniture
DATE:	3/23/2018
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Cedar Ridge
AWARDED TO:	See below in Green

Section/Item	Qty	Marathon		Indoff-Option 1*		Indoff-Option 2*		Lakeshore		Classroom Outfitters		School Specialty		Staples		Midwest Office		Office Essentials		Hertz Furniture		HCONE International		CI Select		Office Depot		Working Spaces		Virco		
		Columbia, MO		Grand, KS		Grand, KS		Carson, CA		Miami, FL		Mansfield, OH		St. Louis, MO		Columbia, MO		St. Louis, MO		Ramsey, NJ		Houston, PA		St. Louis, MO		St. Louis, MO		Columbia, MO		Conway, AR		
		Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	Unit Price	Total Cost	
Section A																																
Item 1																																
2 Shelf Bookcase	142	\$78.66	\$11,169.72	\$80.55	\$11,438.10	\$80.55	\$11,438.10	\$246.05	\$34,939.10	\$84.87	\$12,051.54																					
4 Shelf Bookcase	30	\$120.46	\$3,613.80	\$139.95	\$4,198.50	\$139.95	\$4,198.50	\$379.05	\$11,371.50	\$129.97	\$3,899.10																					
Brand		Global		Lorell		Lorell		Lakeshore		Global				Hon		HON		Hon		Sandusky Lee		HON		HON		Hon		Maxon		Virco		
Item #		91-588-2-36, 91-590-4-36		Fortress Series		Fortress Series		LC228/LC230		91-588-2-36, 91-590-4-36				HS30ABC/HS60ABC		HS30ABC/HS60ABC		HS30ABC/HS60ABC		SNB-30, SNB-60		HS30ABC/HS60ABC		HS30ABC/HS60ABC		756-288, 520-502		M-BS30, M-BS60		BCM3630, BCM3652		
Delivery Time		4 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		7-10 days		6 weeks				3-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		5 weeks		2-6 weeks		
Item 2																																
2 Drawer File Cabinet	48	\$116.28	\$5,581.44	\$114.15	\$5,479.20	\$114.15	\$5,479.20				\$112.75	\$5,412.00																				
4 Drawer File Cabinet	9	\$157.70	\$1,419.30	\$183.65	\$1,652.85	\$183.65	\$1,652.85		No Bid		\$148.83	\$1,339.47																				
Brand		Global		Lorell		Lorell			No Bid		Global			HON		HON		HON		Global		HON		HON		HON		Global		Virco		
Item #		26-201/26-401		Fortress Series		Fortress Series			No Bid		25-201/ 25-401			H312, H314		H312/H314		H312, H314		SGN-225L, 426L		H312 & H314		H312, H314		310 Series		25-201, 25-401		54VF152D, 54VF154D		
Delivery Time		4 weeks		3-4 weeks		3-4 weeks			No Bid		6 weeks			4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		5 weeks		2-6 weeks		
Item 3																																
Teacher Desks	15	\$523.26	\$7,848.90	\$529.95	\$7,949.25	\$361.50	\$5,422.50		No Bid		\$564.57	\$8,468.55																				
Brand		Global		Hon		Hon/Alera			No Bid		Global			H34480		H34480		HP3231		Essendant		HON		HON		H34480		486-718		Maxon		Virco
Item #		SDM2460HH26		H88231		SD6030			No Bid		SDM2460HH20			H34480		H34480		HP3231		Essendant		HON		HON		H34480		486-718		Maxon		Virco
Delivery Time		4 weeks		6 weeks		6 weeks			No Bid		6 weeks			4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		2-3 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		5 weeks		2-6 weeks		
Total Items 1-		\$29,633.16		\$30,717.90		\$28,191.15			Did not bid all items		\$31,170.66			\$33,355.45		\$36,761.22		\$37,672.59		\$36,924.14		\$36,892.08		\$34,823.11		\$41,744.56		\$45,530.81		\$52,741.22		
Installation		\$4,160.00		\$1,750.00		\$1,750.00			\$0.00		\$3,100.00			\$4,730.00		\$2,400.00		\$2,002.77		\$3,692.37		\$5,533.81		\$8,361.11		\$6,720.00		\$7,247.00		\$7,911.19		
Total Section		\$33,793.16		\$32,467.90		\$29,941.15			Did not bid all items		\$34,270.66			\$38,085.45		\$39,161.22		\$39,675.36		\$40,616.51		\$42,425.89		\$43,184.22		\$48,464.56		\$52,777.81		\$60,652.41		
Section B																																
Item 4																																
24"X48" rectangular	77	\$77.95	\$6,002.15	\$77.95	\$6,002.15	\$170.05	\$13,093.85	\$106.00	\$8,162.00	\$90.55	\$6,972.35																					
36"X72" rectangular	8	\$160.75	\$1,286.00	\$160.75	\$1,286.00	\$217.55	\$1,740.40	\$166.00	\$1,328.00	\$147.08	\$1,176.64																					
48" round	201	\$117.50	\$23,617.50	\$117.50	\$23,617.50	\$227.05	\$45,637.05	\$138.00	\$27,738.00	\$127.28	\$25,583.28																					
48"X72" kidney	30	\$166.50	\$4,995.00	\$166.50	\$4,995.00	\$303.05	\$9,091.50	\$186.00	\$5,580.00	\$173.41	\$5,202.30																					
Brand		Scholar Craft		Scholar Craft		Lakeshore		Allied Plastics		Classroom Select				Lorell		Wisonsin Bench		WB Manufacturing		ECR4Kids		Academia										
Item #		FS9400 w/MDF Core		FS9400 w/MDF Core		CN443,453,423,433								LLR9984, 99896, 99897, 99898, 99899																		
Delivery Time		4-6 Weeks		4-6 Weeks		7-10 days		6 weeks		30-45 days				6-8 weeks		4-6 weeks		7-8 weeks		7-8 weeks		4-6 weeks								2-6 weeks		
Item 5																																
Student Desks	79	\$49.99	\$3,949.21	\$49.99	\$3,949.21	\$217.55	\$17,186.45	\$80.47	\$6,357.13	\$53.25	\$4,206.75																					
Brand		Scholar Craft		Scholar Craft		Lakeshore		Scholar Craft		Classroom Select				Lorell		No Bid		WB Manufacturing		ECR4Kids		Academia										
Item #		SC2900FB		SC2900FB		LC788		SC2900FBK						LLR9983		No Bid		WB Manufacturing		ECR4Kids		Academia										
Delivery Time		4-6 weeks		4-6 weeks		7-10 days		6 Weeks		30-45 days				6-8 weeks		No Bid		7-8 weeks		7-8 weeks		4-6 weeks								2-6 weeks		
Warrant		15 years		15 years		Lifetime		Lifetime		Lifetime				Lifetime		No Bid		10 year limited		Lifetime		10 year limited										
Total Items 4 &		\$39,849.86		\$39,849.86		\$86,749.25		\$49,165.13		\$43,141.32				\$42,005.00		Did not bid all items		\$55,924.52		\$73,430.34		\$39,025.70								\$46,427.96		
Installation		\$1,975.00		\$1,975.00		\$0.00		\$7,700.00		\$3,045.00				\$2,000.00				\$5,592.50		\$11,011.09		\$8,361.11								\$6,964.20		
Total Section		\$41,824.86		\$41,824.86		\$86,749.25		\$56,865.13		\$46,186.32				\$44,005.00		Did not bid all items		\$61,517.02		\$84,441.43		\$47,386.81								\$53,392.16		
TOTAL AWARD		\$33,793.16		\$32,467.90		\$29,941.15		\$34,270.66		\$38,085.45		\$39,161.22		\$39,675.36		\$40,616.51		\$42,425.89		\$43,184.22		\$48,464.56		\$52,777.81		\$60,652.41						

*Section A not equal