

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab

BID NO:	RFQ 19/24
SUBJECT:	Musical Instruments
DATE:	7/26/2018
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Music
AWARDED TO:	See Below in Green

Item	Qty	Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc.		Shar Music		Washington Music Center		Taylor Music, Inc.		Jerry's Instrument Repair, LLC		Music & Arts Center		Cascio Interstate Music		Lone Star Percussion		Alamo Music Center		Brook Mays Music		Forrests Music, Inc.		Wichita Band Instrument Co.		Palen Music Center		The Music Suite			
		Westlake Village, CA		Ann Arbor, MI		Wheaton, MD		Aberdeen, SD		Columbia, MO		Dallas, TX		New Berlin, WI		Dallas, TX		San Antonio, TX		Dallas, TX		Berkeley, CA		Wichita, KS		Columbia, MO		Columbia, MO			
		Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost
<b>Yamaha</b>																															
Yamaha Clavinova Piano w/bench	1	No bid			\$0.00	No bid			\$0.00	\$3,433.00	\$3,433.00	No bid		No bid			\$0.00	No bid		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	No bid			\$0.00		\$0.00	
Yamaha Arius Digital Piano w/ bench	1	\$1,450.00	\$1,450.00		\$0.00	\$1,399.00	\$1,399.00		\$0.00	\$1,365.00	\$1,365.00	\$1,545.00	\$1,545.00	\$1,520.90	\$1,520.90		\$0.00	\$2,099.00	\$2,099.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$1,399.99	\$1,399.99		\$0.00		\$0.00
Yamaha Intermediate Tenor Saxophone, Lacquer w/case	1	\$1,998.00	\$1,998.00		\$0.00	\$1,612.60	\$1,612.60		\$0.00	No bid		\$1,907.00	\$1,907.00	\$1,910.90	\$1,910.90		\$0.00	\$2,699.00	\$2,699.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$2,059.00	\$2,059.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Yamaha Series 3-Valve, ¾ BBB Tuba, Lacquer w/case	4	\$3,110.00	\$12,440.00		\$0.00	\$2,658.40	\$10,633.60		\$0.00	No bid		\$2,658.00	\$10,632.00	\$2,669.90	\$10,679.60		\$0.00	\$3,250.00	\$13,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$2,880.00	\$11,520.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Conn Double Horn, Nickel Silver, Fixed	1	\$3,896.00	\$3,896.00		\$0.00	\$3,309.20	\$3,309.20		\$0.00	\$0.00		\$3,328.00	\$3,328.00	\$3,315.90	\$3,315.90		\$0.00	\$3,750.00	\$3,750.00	\$3,580.00	\$3,580.00		\$0.00	\$3,847.00	\$3,847.00	\$3,690.00	\$3,690.00	\$3,829.00	\$3,829.00		\$0.00
Holton Farkas Series, Fixed Bell,	4	\$3,697.00	\$14,788.00		\$0.00	\$3,143.10	\$12,572.40		\$0.00	\$0.00		\$3,161.00	\$12,644.00	\$3,150.90	\$12,603.60		\$0.00	\$3,625.00	\$14,500.00	\$3,399.00	\$13,596.00		\$0.00	\$3,654.00	\$14,616.00	\$3,505.00	\$14,020.00	\$3,649.40	\$14,597.60		\$0.00
Pageantry Innovations Double Mixer	1	\$2,658.00	\$2,658.00		\$0.00	No bid		\$2,990.00	\$2,990.00	\$0.00		\$2,754.00	\$2,754.00	No bid		\$2,916.25	\$2,916.25	\$2,899.00	\$2,899.00	No bid		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,899.00	\$2,899.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
King 4 Valve/4 BBb Tuba, Lacquer	10	\$5,750.00	\$57,500.00		\$0.00	\$4,878.60	\$48,786.00		\$0.00	\$0.00		\$4,906.00	\$49,060.00	\$4,888.90	\$48,889.00		\$0.00	\$5,475.00	\$54,750.00	\$5,275.00	\$52,750.00		\$0.00	\$5,599.00	\$55,990.00	\$5,440.00	\$54,400.00	\$5,576.00	\$55,760.00		\$0.00
Adams 3.0 Octave Concert Vibraphone w/field frame and no	1	\$3,740.00	\$3,740.00		\$0.00	\$3,280.70	\$3,280.70	\$3,233.00	\$3,233.00	\$0.00		\$3,312.00	\$3,312.00	\$3,265.90	\$3,265.90	\$3,484.50	\$3,484.50	\$3,489.00	\$3,489.00	No bid		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$3,557.00	\$3,557.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Franz Hoffmann Prelude Bass ½ size	3	No bid		\$1,549.00	\$4,647.00	No bid			\$0.00	\$0.00		No bid		No bid				No bid		No bid		\$0.00		\$0.00	No bid			\$0.00		\$0.00	
Yamaha Clavinova digital piano	1	No bid			\$0.00	No bid			\$0.00	See note		No bid		No bid				No bid		No bid		\$0.00		\$0.00	No bid			\$0.00		\$0.00	
Yamaha Custom Z Alto Saxophone,	4	\$3,480.00	\$13,920.00		\$0.00	\$3,042.95	\$12,171.80		\$0.00	\$0.00		\$3,042.00	\$12,168.00	\$3,058.90	\$12,235.60		\$0.00	\$3,874.00	\$15,496.00	No bid		\$0.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$3,296.00	\$13,184.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Fox Renard Model 51 Bassoon w/case	1	\$4,128.00	\$4,128.00		\$0.00	\$3,916.65	\$3,916.65	\$3,933.00	\$3,933.00	\$4,264.00	\$4,264.00	\$3,933.00	\$3,933.00	\$3,929.90	\$3,929.90		\$0.00	\$4,400.00	\$4,400.00	\$4,108.00	\$4,108.00	\$4,578.00	\$4,578.00		\$0.00	\$4,042.00	\$4,042.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Fox Renard Model 220 Bassoon	1	\$7,350.00	\$7,350.00		\$0.00	\$6,822.50	\$6,822.50	\$6,811.00	\$6,811.00	\$7,219.00	\$7,219.00	\$6,851.00	\$6,851.00	\$6,835.90	\$6,835.90		\$0.00	\$8,250.00	\$8,250.00	\$7,088.00	\$7,088.00	\$7,905.00	\$7,905.00		\$0.00	\$7,006.00	\$7,006.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
King 2280 Legend Soloist Euphonium, Lacquer w/case	2	\$1,890.00	\$3,780.00		\$0.00	\$1,599.50	\$3,199.00		\$0.00	\$1,859.00	\$3,718.00	\$1,607.00	\$3,214.00	\$1,603.90	\$3,207.80		\$0.00	\$1,799.00	\$3,598.00	\$1,729.00	\$3,458.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,784.00	\$3,568.00	\$1,979.00	\$3,958.00		\$0.00	
King 2341W Series 4-Valve, 4/4 BBb Tuba, Lacquer w/case	2	\$5,770.00	\$11,540.00		\$0.00	\$4,878.60	\$9,757.20		\$0.00	\$5,599.00	\$11,198.00	\$4,906.00	\$9,812.00	\$4,889.90	\$9,779.80		\$0.00	\$5,475.00	\$10,950.00	\$5,275.00	\$10,550.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$5,440.00	\$10,880.00	\$5,576.00	\$11,152.00		\$0.00	
Conn 6D Double Horn, Nickel, fixed bell w/case	6	\$2,747.00	\$16,482.00		\$0.00	\$2,335.55	\$14,013.30		\$0.00	\$2,714.00	\$16,284.00	\$2,349.00	\$14,094.00	\$2,341.90	\$14,051.40		\$0.00	\$2,680.00	\$16,080.00	\$2,526.00	\$15,156.00		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,605.00	\$15,630.00	\$2,776.00	\$16,656.00		\$0.00	