

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Unofficial Bid Tab

BID NO:	RFQ 19/11
SUBJECT:	Projectors
DATE:	5/24/2018
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Tech Svs
AWARDED TO:	See below in yellow

Vendor	Epson Powerlite 680 XGA	Epson Powerlite 108 XGA	Casio Advanced XJ-F10X	Chief Ceiling Mount
PCMG, Inc. Dayton, OH	\$528.00	\$725.00	\$725.00	\$130.00
KCAV Kansas City, MO	1-2 \$923.00, 3+ \$883.00	1-4 \$519.00, 5+ \$509.00	\$728.40	\$98.00
CDW-G BID 1 Vernon Hills, IL	\$908.00	\$499.00	\$649.00	\$107.00
CDW-G BID 2* Vernon Hills, IL	\$908.00	\$742.00	\$564.00	No Bid
SDF Professional Co* Greenville, NC	\$925.00	\$500.00	\$710.00	No Bid
IT Savvy Addison, IL	\$927.43	\$516.02	\$754.20	\$129.12
CCS Lenexa, KS	\$930.90	\$527.15	\$892.49	\$95.16
B&H Photo New York, NY	\$943.00	\$513.00	\$756.00	\$130.00
HyperTec USA Tempe, AZ	\$989.00	\$545.00	\$750.00	\$129.00
AKA Comp Solutions Chicago, IL	\$1,030.80	\$558.22	\$731.57	\$127.03
School Specialty St. Louis, MO	\$1,115.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Adorama New York, NY	\$1,141.84	\$566.80	No Bid	\$136.45
Embark IT West Des Moines, IA	\$1,148.18	\$568.40	No Bid	\$154.61
Tech Electronics Columbia, MO	\$1,266.57	\$717.57	\$1,054.56	\$162.14
Howard Technology Solutions Laurel, MS	\$1,247.00	\$554.00	\$805.00	\$130.00

* Did not include signed addenda