

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid Result

BID NO:	RFQ 20/05
SUBJECT:	Mitel Phone Equipment
DATE:	5/7/2019
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Tech Svs
AWARDED TO:	Blue Ally

Options	BlueAlly		Telesource Services, Inc.	
	Unit Price for Qty 1-9	Unit Price for Qty 10-50	Unit Price for Qty 1-9	Unit Price for Qty 10-50
Mitel IP655 Conference Phones w/ anti-glare	\$359.52	\$359.52	\$502.12	\$475.58
Mitel IP420 Classroom Phones	\$90.72	\$90.72	\$156.52	\$147.31
Mitel IP400 Wall Mount Kits	\$15.00	\$15.00	No bid	No bid
Mitel IP485G Desk Phones	\$205.92	\$205.92	\$355.21	\$334.37
Mitel IP655 Microphone Wired Phones	\$93.60	\$93.60	\$164.05	\$154.40
Handset IP930D	\$95.52	\$95.52	\$164.80	\$155.11
Mitel ST100	\$1,056.00	\$1,056.00	\$1,656.19	\$1,558.77
Mitel ST100	\$1,689.60	\$1,689.60	No bid	No bid
Extension Only License	\$47.52	\$47.52	\$118.38	\$111.42
Mitel Rack Mount Tray Kit for SG Switch 1U Half width Holds two 1U (10223)	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$85.45	\$80.43