

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab

BID NO:	RFQ 20/45
SUBJECT:	Dell Computers
DATE:	12/11/2019
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Tech Svs
AWARDED TO:	CDW-G

		CDW-G	HyperTech	Mvation	Sufian/Clary	Premier	Howard
#1	OPTIPLEX 3070 MICRO TOWER						
	Specifications Met						
	BASE PRICE	\$ 568.00	\$ 563.58	\$ 778.60	\$ 730.00		\$ 791.00
	Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty	\$ 568.00	\$ 563.58	-	\$ 730.00		\$ 791.00
	Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty	\$ 584.00	\$ 579.49	-	\$ 730.00		No Bid
	Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty	\$ 605.00	\$ 602.76	\$ 778.60	\$ 730.00	Response did not include pricing sheet	No Bid
	Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty	\$ 645.00	\$ 648.59	\$ 903.60	\$ 805.00		No Bid
	Awarded Unit Cost						

#2	LATITUDE 5500 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL						
	Specifications Met						
	BASE PRICE	766	\$ 986.13	\$ 1,086.99	1112		\$ 1,291.00
	Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty	\$ 766.00	\$ 986.13	\$ 1,086.99	\$ 1,112.00		\$ 1,291.00
	Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty	\$ 820.00	\$ 1,024.52	-	N/A		No Bid
	Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty	\$ 852.00	\$ 1,084.64	\$ 1,340.99	\$ 1,240.00		No Bid
	Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty	\$ 906.00	\$ 1,144.75	\$ 1,460.99	\$ 1,462.00		No Bid
	Awarded Unit Cost						