

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result

BID NO:	RFQ 20/48
SUBJECT:	Apple iPad Protetive Cases
DATE:	12/12/2019
SCHOOL/DEPT:	IT
AWARDED TO:	See below in green

Vendor	Cases					Keyboard					
	Unit Cost	Sample Brand	1-50	51-100	101-500	Unit Cost	Sample Brand	Sample Included	1-50	51-100	101-500
JourneyEd Allen, TX	\$26.95	Gumdrop droptech Clear	\$30.95	\$28.95	\$26.95	\$49.85	Belkin/B2B130	No	\$52.25	\$50.05	\$49.85
ACP CreativIT LLC Buffalo Grove, IL	\$31.00	Brenthaven Model 2890	\$31.00	\$31.00	\$31.00	\$41.00	Kensington K72447WW Wired Keyboard	Yes	\$41.00	\$41.00	\$41.00
Techcycle Solutions Overland Park, KS	\$40.00	Brenthaven #2890	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$60.00	Brenthaven #1018	Yes	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00
Howard Technology Solutions Ellisville, MS	\$14.00	Nutkase/NK136B-EL	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$14.00	\$42.00	Belkin/B2B130	No	\$42.00	\$42.00	\$42.00
Firefly Computers St. Paul, MN	\$15.80	Nutkase NK Rugged Case NK136B-EL	\$15.80	\$15.80	\$15.80	No bid					
Apple Inc. Austin, TX	\$349.50	STM Dux Plus Duo				\$49.95	Brenthaven Eduge HN0K2VC/A	No			
Sunrise Hitek Chicago, IL	\$22.00	STC-I102-K	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$37.00	HITEK KBD-SPIN-W	Yes	\$41.00	\$40.00	\$39.00
S&K Associates Playa Del Rey, CA	\$15.00	Peptune	\$35.00	\$30.00	\$28.00	\$47.00	Peptune	Yes	\$78.00	\$75.00	\$73.00
Tierney -Option 1 St. Paul, MN	\$14.27	NutKase NK NK136B-EL	\$14.27	\$14.27	\$14.24	\$28.25	AC-Lightkey-MFI Apple Mfi	Yes	\$28.25	\$28.25	\$28.25
Tierney -Option 2 St. Paul, MN						\$35.00	B2B124 Belkin Secure wired	Yes	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
Tierney -Option 3 St. Paul, MN						\$39.40	Belkin/B2B130	Yes	\$39.40	\$39.40	\$39.40
Omnium Group, LLC Houston, TX	\$33.06	Gumdrop dropTech clear 01A001	\$33.06	\$33.06	\$33.06	\$43.98	Belkin/B2B124	No	\$43.98	\$43.98	\$43.98
School Specialty-5th & 6th keyboard Appleton, WI	No Bid					\$70.98	Brydge	No	\$70.98	\$70.98	\$70.98
School Specialty -10.2 keyboard Appleton, WI	No Bid					\$101.62	Brydge	No	\$101.62	\$101.62	\$101.62
Too Good Boucherville, QC	\$40.50	MW742LL/A	\$40.50	\$40.50	\$39.50	No bid					
HPI International Brooklyn, NY	\$27.15	Gumdrop 01A001	\$27.96	\$27.69	\$27.42	\$32.67	Zagg 12" keyboard Wired ZG12KB-BB	No	\$33.65	\$33.32	\$32.99
SCW Marietta, GA	\$32.44	Otterbox 77-62038	\$32.44	\$32.44	\$32.44	No bid					