

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid Tab

BID NO:	RFQ 21/09
SUBJECT:	Clear Touch Interactive Panels
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Tech Svs
AWARDED TO:	KCAV

	KCAV Kansas City, MO		JMG SERVICES, INC. Yorkville, IL		AITA TECHNOLOGIES		PARMETECH, INC. Havertown, PA		HOWARD TECHNOLOGY SOLUTIONS Laurel, MS		DATA CONNECT ENTERPRISE Olney, MD		CLARY BUSINESS SOLUTIONS** San Diego, CA	
65"	Option A	Option B	Option A	Option B	Option A	Option B	Option A	Option B	Option A	Option B	Option A	Option B	Option A	Option B
Qty 1-25	\$2,399.00	\$2,399.00	\$2,900.00	\$3,200.00	\$2,989.45	\$3,167.67	\$2,949.00	\$3,124.00	\$3,021.36	\$3,202.36	\$3,479.86	\$3,655.18	\$1,695.00	\$1,795.00
Qty 26-50	\$2,349.00	\$2,349.00	\$2,900.00	\$3,200.00	\$2,989.45	\$3,167.67	\$2,899.00	\$3,074.00	\$2,884.86	\$3,065.86	\$3,914.02	\$4,089.54	\$1,645.00	\$1,745.00
Qty 51-75	\$2,339.00	\$2,339.00	\$2,900.00	\$3,200.00	\$2,989.45	\$3,167.67	\$2,889.00	\$3,064.00	\$2,879.55	\$3,060.55	\$3,914.02	\$4,089.54	\$1,595.00	\$1,695.00
Qty 76-100	\$2,339.00	\$2,339.00	\$2,900.00	\$3,200.00	\$2,989.45	\$3,167.67	\$2,879.00	\$3,054.00	\$2,872.03	\$3,053.03	\$5,049.41	\$5,224.93	\$1,545.00	\$1,645.00
Qty 101-200	\$2,339.00	\$2,339.00	\$2,900.00	\$3,200.00	\$2,989.45	\$3,167.67	\$2,869.00	\$3,044.00	\$2,879.55	\$3,060.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,495.00	\$1,595.00
75"														
Qty 1-25	\$3,275.00	\$3,275.00	\$3,600.00	\$3,900.00	\$4,047.74	\$4,333.25	\$3,989.00	\$4,269.00	\$4,093.36	\$4,383.36	\$4,956.26	\$5,237.52	\$2,195.00	\$2,295.00
Qty 26-50	\$3,249.00	\$3,249.00	\$3,600.00	\$3,900.00	\$4,047.74	\$4,333.25	\$3,949.00	\$4,229.00	\$3,974.10	\$4,264.10	\$4,956.26	\$5,237.52	\$2,145.00	\$2,245.00
Qty 51-75	\$3,239.00	\$3,239.00	\$3,600.00	\$3,900.00	\$4,047.74	\$4,333.25	\$3,929.00	\$4,209.00	\$3,951.55	\$4,241.55	\$6,091.66	\$6,367.88	\$2,095.00	\$2,195.00
Qty 76-100	\$3,239.00	\$3,239.00	\$3,600.00	\$3,900.00	\$4,047.74	\$4,333.25	\$3,909.00	\$4,189.00	\$3,944.03	\$4,234.03	\$6,091.66	\$6,367.88	\$2,045.00	\$2,145.00
Qty 101-200	\$3,239.00	\$3,239.00	\$3,600.00	\$3,900.00	\$4,047.74	\$4,333.25	\$3,889.00	\$4,169.00	\$3,951.55	\$4,241.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,995.00	\$2,095.00
86"														
Qty 1-25	\$5,898.00	\$5,898.00	\$5,100.00	\$5,400.00	\$7,575.37	\$8,004.10	\$7,479.00	\$7,899.00	\$7,665.36	\$8,100.36	\$8,430.31	\$8,852.65	\$2,545.00	\$2,645.00
Qty 26-50	\$5,850.00	\$5,850.00	\$5,100.00	\$5,400.00	\$7,575.37	\$8,004.10	\$7,429.00	\$7,849.00	\$7,546.10	\$7,981.10	\$8,430.31	\$8,852.65	\$2,495.00	\$2,595.00
Qty 51-75	\$5,839.00	\$5,839.00	\$5,100.00	\$5,400.00	\$7,575.37	\$8,004.10	\$7,419.00	\$7,839.00	\$7,523.55	\$7,958.55	\$9,565.81	\$9,988.04	\$2,445.00	\$2,545.00
Qty 76-100	\$5,839.00	\$5,839.00	\$5,100.00	\$5,400.00	\$7,575.37	\$8,004.10	\$7,409.00	\$7,829.00	\$7,531.03	\$7,951.03	\$9,565.81	\$9,988.04	\$2,395.00	\$2,495.00
Qty 101-200	\$5,839.00	\$5,839.00	\$5,100.00	\$5,400.00	\$7,575.37	\$8,004.10	\$7,399.00	\$7,819.00	\$7,523.55	\$7,958.55	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,345.00	\$2,445.00
Mount Brand	Clear Touch CTI-Mount-Fix W-V3	Clear Touch CTI-MOUNT- FIX-V3	Clear Touch CTI-MOUNT- FIX-V3	Clear Touch CTI-MOUNT- FIX-V3	Clear Touch CTI-MOUNT- FIXW-V3	Clear Touch CTI-MOUNT- FIXW-V3	Clear Touch CTI-MOUNT- FIXW-V3	Clear Touch CTI-MOUNT- FIXW-V3	Cleartouch 6000K Series	Cleartouch 6000K Series	Clear Touch CTI-6065, 6075,6086	Clear Touch CTI-6065, 6075,6086	Onescreen Wall Mount	Onescreen Wall Mount

**Did not bid Cleartouch