
BID NO:
SUBJECT:
DATE:
SCHOOL/DEPT:
AWARDED TO:

Total if 
Awarded All

Cost Manfurfacturer Cost Manfurfacturer Cost Manfurfacturer Total

$29,567.38

KI $92,005.55 6-10 weeks, Bid is all or none 
$91,955.55Pleasant Valley, MO

Mooreco & Smith 
Systems NA 4-6 weeksGreenville, MO

SSI FURNISHINGS $53,151.05 Russwood $12,714.95 Smith Systems $26,139.55

SCHOOL SPECIALTY No Bid $10,561.78 Mooreco & Smith 
System

$28,993.43 KI NA 6-10 weeksSt Louis, MO
OFFICE ESSENTIALS No bid $13,347.68 Smith Systems

KI $105,726.32 7-10 weeksCarrollton, TX
INSIDE THE LINES No Bid $14,906.25 Smith Systems $26,185.26 KI NA 8 weeksColumbia, MO

KI NA Mid JuneSt Louis, MO
FURNITURE BY WILLIAM WEBB $58,063.05 Russwood $15,296.30 Smith Systems $32,366.97

CI SELECT No Bid $12,903.27 Smith Systems $28,811.33

SSI Furnishings

Vendor Russwood (or Equal) Smith System (or Equal) KI (or Equal)

Delivery ARO

Warner MS

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid Result

RFP 20/58
Media Center Furnishing at Warner MS

3/30/2020


