

**RFQ C-19010**  
**FOOD AND PAPER GOODS**

Food and Paper goods for the District Food Service program consists of approximately 450 various food items (frozen and dry goods) and paper items (food bags, food handling gloves, lunch trays, utensil packets, towels and cleaners. The intent of bid is to award all items or a majority of the items to one vendor by product grouping. Bids were received from five bidders and recommendation of award is to Kohls Wholesale for grocery and paper based on a ranking system of price per unit, eligibility for licensing/certification, responsiveness of most or all items in each category, willingness, ability to supply desired brand/product, experience with this district or districts of comparable size and services needed, percentage of items bid, responsibility and comparable business references.

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Estimated Yearly Cost</b>
<b>KOHL'S WHOLESALE</b> – Quincy, IL	\$317,650.81

Award to **KOHL'S WHOLESALE**, Quincy, IL

Description	Currently using, will except alt. if low and meets specs unless pre-screened	Purchase Unit	Estimate Usage	SGC Prices	SGC Total Expenditure per unit	Graves	Graves Total Expenditure per unit	US Foods	US Foods Total Expenditure per unit	Bid price	Kohl Total Expenditure per unit	SPC Paper only	SPC Total Expenditure per unit	Wilsos Bid price Produce only	Wilsos Total Expenditure per unit
Beef Description	Currently using	Purchase Unit	Estimate Usage												
CN Beef Patties Low Sodium Flame Broiled fully cooked	JTM 2.45 oz and Advance Pierre 2.25 oz #3742	Case 196 ct & 144ct	273	\$73.95	\$0.51	\$73.14	\$0.51	\$74.15	\$0.51	\$72.84	\$0.51		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
CN Beef Patties low sodium and all beef fully cooked	JTM 2.45 oz #5670	196 ct	150	\$73.95	\$0.51	\$108.40	\$0.55	\$109.92	\$0.56	\$108.75	\$0.55		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Beef Taco Filling	JTM #5240	Case, 6/5#	29	\$48.97	\$2.72	\$31.21	\$1.50	\$98.40	\$3.28	\$48.95	\$2.45		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
<b>Chicken &amp; Turkey Description</b>	<b>All chicken products must be fully cooked whole muscle, some NOI, CN labeled for grain and meat (MMA), no trans fats, WG if crusted, low-sodium,</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>	<b>Estimate Usage</b>												
Chicken Southern Tender Frit all white meat WG, 2 MMA, 2 grain per 3 pc. (screened)	Pro View	100/1.6 oz pc.	650	\$75.24	\$2.51	\$29.96	\$2.80	\$57.46	\$2.87	\$57.95	\$2.90		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Dark Meat NOI, Chicken Gen Tso dark meat NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 30#	7	\$93.44	\$3.12	\$41.16	\$1.26	\$94.03	\$3.14	\$92.26	\$3.08		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Drk w/Gen Tso's Sauce NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 142/4 oz	89	\$118.89	\$3.32	\$129.42	\$4.18	\$118.62	\$3.39	\$117.25	\$3.13		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Drumstick Buffalo or Mesquite, specify flavor NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 6/5#	316	Wt Missing \$ 74.24	\$3.35	\$83.20	\$2.68	\$73.70	\$2.46	\$73.86	\$2.46		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Fajita Meat NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case, 30#	47	\$127.61	\$3.19	\$92.81	\$2.91	\$84.77	\$2.83	\$29.44	\$1.96		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Meatballs NOI dark meat	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 2/5#	794	\$23.79	\$2.38	\$26.57	\$2.66	\$24.23	\$2.42	\$24.42	\$2.44		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Chunk (screened) all white whole muscle, WG, prefer no corn product if avail. NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 30# (126 servings)	1750	Missing case wt. \$58.17	\$3.85	\$90.27	\$2.77	\$87.83	\$2.93	\$92.23	\$3.08		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Patty BR SP NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 148/3.5oz	454	Missing Case wt. \$58.87	\$2.89	\$73.32	\$2.31	Missing case wt. \$58.86	\$2.89	\$55.21	\$1.73		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Patty Plain Brd NOI (2 MMA)	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 49/3.25 oz	1723	Missing Case wt. \$57.52	\$3.01	\$73.15	\$2.31	Missing case \$50.5	\$3.01	\$25.80	\$2.41		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Pepperoni NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 20#	106	Wt. no brand disqual. \$96.16	\$6.50	\$68.00	\$3.21	\$96.66	\$4.83	\$104.00	\$5.20		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Sausage NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 30#	301	Missing Case wt. no brand name disqual. \$40.51	\$3.71	\$44.34	\$1.60	\$40.85	\$1.36	\$97.32	\$2.97		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Taco Meat NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case, 20#	180	\$48.71	\$2.44	\$52.39	\$1.09	\$50.92	\$2.55	\$48.85	\$2.44		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Tangerine NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case, 5/5.4#	409	\$118.40	\$3.31	\$129.07	\$3.44	\$116.61	\$3.26	\$117.25	\$3.30		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Chunk Hny Sriracha or spicy all white whole muscle, WG NOI	Tyson and Gold Kist	Case 30# (88 servings)	200	No Cs Wt. \$79.31	\$4.40	\$78.95	\$2.63	\$79.74	\$2.85	\$81.13	\$2.72		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Corn Dog 2 grains, 2 MMA, CN labeled	foster farms	Case 72/4oz	960	\$28.85	\$0.40	\$31.20	\$0.43	\$28.71	\$0.40	\$27.50	\$0.38		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Tornado Chicken WG, 2 MMA, 2 grain serving	El Monterey	Case, 24/3oz	427	\$14.42	\$0.60	\$79.29	\$0.55	\$14.58	\$0.61	\$14.65	\$0.61		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Chicken Crispiito Chili WG, 2 MMA, 2 grains	State Fair	72/3.45 oz case	1766	\$29.13	\$0.40	\$30.08	\$0.42	\$27.20	\$0.38	\$35.42	\$0.49		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Turkey Breast Roast fully cooked deli sliced	Whole muscle, low fat low sodium	Case 4/5.25#	3	\$3.58	\$3.58	\$3.16	\$3.16	\$52.13	\$4.35	\$42.80	\$3.57		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Turkey Sliced Ham fully cooked deli sliced	Whole muscle, low fat low sodium	Case 12#	329	\$42.61	\$3.47	\$3.46	\$3.46	\$70.88	\$3.94	\$42.16	\$3.51		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
<b>Total NOI</b>					\$61.57		\$46.62		\$59.95	\$55.99	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA
<b>Entrees Description</b>	<b>All Entrees must be CN labeled for grain, MMA, and fruit</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>	<b>Estimate Usage</b>												
Egg Roll Pork & vegetable 3 oz, 1 MMA, 1 Grain	Mihn 69204	Case 60/3 oz	46	\$33.13	\$0.55	\$32.40	\$0.54	\$35.09	\$0.58	\$32.63	\$0.54		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Packaged Meals with 2 WG grains, 2 MMA low fat low sodium cold lunch	Ready to go meals Example Tasty Brands Anytimer or Notables	Please specify	200	NO BID	\$2.10	\$60.49	\$1.68	\$73.01	\$1.53	\$67.94	\$1.42				
Packaged Meals with 2 WG grains, 2 MMA low fat low sodium hot lunch	Ready to go meals	Please specify	200	NO BID	\$2.10	\$60.49	\$1.68	\$85.58	\$0.90	\$70.57	\$1.47				
Packaged Meals with 2 WG grains, 2 MMA low fat low sodium cold breakfast with fruit	Ready to go meals Example Tasty Brands Anytimer	Please specify	200	\$38.45	\$0.87	\$60.49	\$1.68	\$41.89	\$0.88	see list					
Packaged Meals with 2 WG grains, 2 MMA low fat low sodium lunch w/ fruit	Ready to go meals	Please specify	200	NO BID	\$2.52	\$60.49	\$1.68	\$71.57	\$1.50	\$71.40	\$1.49				
Rice Vegetable Fried WG 1 grain minimum kit	Mihn 69704	Case 84/5.9oz	24	NO BID	\$0.73	\$48.54	\$0.58	\$51.21	\$0.61	\$47.62	\$0.57		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Lasagna Cheese Roll, WG, 2 MMA, 2 grain	Tasty Brand	Case, 110/4.1oz	11	\$25.50	\$0.55	\$70.53	\$0.64	\$71.83	\$0.65	\$69.80	\$0.63		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Uncrustable Grape Lg NOI WG, 2 MMA, 2 Grains	Smucker's	Case 72/5.3 oz	2015	\$67.60	\$0.94	\$65.62	\$0.91	\$65.45	\$0.91	\$66.05	\$0.92		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Uncrustable Stwb Small NOI, WG, 1 MMA, 1 grain	Smucker's	Case 72/2.6 oz	23	\$39.06	\$0.54	\$34.35	\$0.48	\$40.96	\$0.57	\$38.77	\$0.54		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Uncrustable WW 5.3oz NOI, WG, 2 MMA, 2 Grains	Smucker's	Case 72/5.3oz	129	\$67.60	\$0.94	\$70.52	\$0.98	\$71.42	\$0.99	\$69.08	\$0.96		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Uncrustable NOI, WG, MMA, 1 Grains	Smucker's	Case 72/2.8oz	3000	\$37.32	\$0.52	\$39.81	\$0.55	\$36.54	\$0.51	\$37.11	\$0.52		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Hot Dog All Meat	Case, 10#	19	\$15.70	\$1.57	\$22.65	\$2.16	\$18.04	\$1.80	\$15.90	\$1.59			#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Pork Crumbles fully cooked	Case, 20#	4	\$24.42	\$2.44	\$71.05	\$1.70	\$19.24	\$1.92	\$51.80	\$2.59			#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
BBQ Pork Rib Patty fully cooked 2 MMA	Pierre 3834	Case, 160/2.4 oz	33	\$43.01	\$0.43	\$31.83	\$0.32	\$34.17	\$0.34	\$48.67	\$0.30		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Turkey or chicken Maple Pancake Wrap WG, 2 oz MMA, 2 grains	Specify case size and count	New		\$19.49	\$0.32	\$19.33	\$0.32	\$22.22	\$0.40	\$26.12	\$0.38		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
<b>Cheese Products and Pizza Descriptions</b>	<b>Currently Using</b>	<b>Estimate Usage</b>	<b>Purchase price</b>												
Cheese Bites NOI, WG, 2 grain, 2 meat per 4 bites (screened)	Wild Mike's	Case 240/1 oz	377	NO BID	\$0.31	\$56.07	\$0.23	\$56.58	\$0.24	\$55.62	\$0.23		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Cheese Mozz Shred low fat NOI (screened for HS pizza oven pizza)	Land' O Lakes NOI #41698 no alternates	Case 4/5#	54	\$49.37	\$1.65	\$50.79	\$1.08	\$50.60	\$2.53	\$49.02	\$2.45		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Cheese Sliced American CN labeled	4/5# Case	1	\$39.65	\$1.98	\$66.76	\$2.23	\$38.38	\$1.92	\$34.87	\$1.74			#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Cheese Bread Stick NOI, WG, 2 grain, 2 meat per 2 sticks (screened)	Wild Mike's	Case 112/2 oz	121	NO BID	\$0.60	\$51.36	\$0.46	\$53.33	\$0.48	\$50.46	\$0.45		#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Cheese Pizza Rippers, WG, 2 grains, 2 MMA	105/4 oz portions	100	NO BID	\$0.95	NO BID	\$0.95	\$79.10	\$0.75	\$77.13	\$0.73			#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!
Cheese Pepperoni Pizza Rippers WG, 2 grains, 2 MMA	105/4 oz portions	100	NO BID	\$0.95	NO BID	\$0.95	\$80.12	\$0.76	\$78.15	\$0.74			#DIV/0!		#DIV/0!

Cheese Turkey Ham Rippers, WG, 2 grains, 2 MMA		105/4 oz portions	100	NO BID	\$0.95	NO BID	\$0.95	\$79.56	\$0.76	\$77.59	\$0.74		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Pizza Cheese Round 5" 2 MMA, 2grains	ConAgra The Max	Case 60 ct./5.05 oz	100	\$43.78	\$0.73	\$35.70	\$0.60	\$37.44	\$0.62	\$47.69	\$0.79		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Pizza Cheese Wedge WG, 2 MMA, 2 grains Screened	Nordone, 88828, no alternates	Case, 96/4.9oz	1203	\$44.53	\$0.47	\$51.49	\$0.54	\$40.95	\$0.43	\$49.55	\$0.52		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Pizza Cheese 16" 2 MMA, 2 grains	Schwanz Big Daddy 78985	Case 72 slice	650	\$62.60	\$0.87	\$60.66	\$0.83	\$61.10	\$0.85	\$60.93	\$0.82		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Breaded Mozz. Crunchy Pizza Cheese 2 MMA, 2 grains NOI	Riches 65225	Case 72/5.48 servings, 25# case	313	\$59.60	\$0.83	\$58.25	\$0.91	\$58.26	\$0.81	\$57.95	\$0.81		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cheese Buffalo style chicken rippers, WG 2 grains, 2 MMA		105/4 oz portions	100	NO BID	\$0.96	NO BID	\$0.96	\$81.34	\$0.77	\$76.98	\$0.73		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cheese Sauce Pouches, liquid or dry	land' O Lakes NOI or Trio	Case 6/106oz	144	\$70.29	\$1.64	\$70.54	\$1.65	\$67.26	\$1.57	\$66.33	\$1.55		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cheese SticK IW MarbleJack low fat, small case size ≤ 10-30 lbs cases size	Bongards	Case 168 1 oz	80	\$38.18	\$0.23	\$49.69	\$0.30	\$44.33	\$0.26	\$32.63	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cheese String IW low fat small case size ≤ 10-30 lbs	Bongards	Case 168/1oz	251	\$28.81	\$0.18	\$33.79	\$0.20	\$35.30	\$0.21	\$33.57	\$0.20		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cheese String IW low fat small case size ≤ 10-30 lbs		Case 96/1oz	36	\$28.81	\$0.18	\$33.79	\$0.20	No Bid	\$0.25	\$19.62	\$0.20		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
<b>Entrée and Cheese Totals</b>					\$30.61		\$28.93		\$27.31		\$26.84		NA	NA
<b>Grains Description</b>	<b>Currently Using All Grains must be 8-16g of Whole Grain &amp; 0 transfat to = 1-2 CN grain equivalent (WG)</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>												
Bagel Cinn Crm Chs 2 Grains WG, IW	Pillsbury	Case, 72/2.43oz	340	\$29.12	\$0.40	\$30.49	\$0.42	\$28.82	\$0.40	\$29.35	\$0.41		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Bagel Straw Crm Chs 2 Grains WG, IW	Pillsbury	Case, 72/2.43oz	626	\$29.12	\$0.40	\$30.40	\$0.42	\$28.31	\$0.39	\$29.35	\$0.41		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Granola Bar BS Chewy nut free WG				\$31.61	\$0.26	\$30.07	\$0.21	No Bid	\$0.33	\$23.20	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Biscuit Buttermilk 2.2 oz White flour	Bridgeford	100/2.2 oz	163	\$25.58	\$0.26	\$24.00	\$0.24	\$26.39	\$0.26	\$16.82	\$0.23		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Biscuits WG 16g		Case 175/1oz	107	\$19.73	\$0.11	\$15.69	\$0.13	\$20.34	\$0.12	\$20.37	\$0.12		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Bread stick apple WG	Bosco	Case 72/3.02 oz	31	\$32.17	\$0.45	\$34.78	\$0.48	\$35.79	\$0.50	\$34.47	\$0.48		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cheese SticK W/G 6"	Bosco	Case 144/6"	13	\$51.03	\$0.35	\$50.26	\$0.35	\$50.22	\$0.35	\$49.32	\$0.34		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cheese SticK W/G 7"	Bosco	Case 144/7"	216	\$54.72	\$0.51	\$40.88	\$0.38	\$41.95	\$0.39	\$49.32	\$0.34		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Bread Ciabatta sliced WG	Pillsbury	Case 96/1.8 oz	64	\$24.36	\$0.25	\$19.19	\$0.20	\$26.76	\$0.28	\$25.70	\$0.27		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Bread French Garlic multi-Cheese WG 6"	Schwanz/Tony's	Case 60ct	339	NO BID- DISCONTINUE	\$0.86	\$40.14	\$0.67	\$41.61	\$0.69	\$39.55	\$0.66		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Breadstick WG, 1 grain, soft		Case, 144/1.5oz	11	\$24.55	\$0.15	\$21.81	\$0.09	\$20.68	\$0.12	\$21.60	\$0.15		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Bread thick sliced garlic french, WG pre-baked		Case 125/1.2 oz serving	100	\$23.67	\$0.20	\$24.16	\$0.20	\$22.96	\$0.18	\$25.79	\$0.43		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Bun Hamburger WG 3" Bun Hoagie 6" WG sliced 2 oz	Sara Lee on bid, this bid used as a back up Rotella	120 ct Case 54/2oz	41 1313	\$20.62 \$28.77	\$0.17 \$0.30	\$23.20 \$22.05	\$0.12 \$0.31	\$23.05 \$19.30	\$0.19 \$0.36	\$20.25 \$22.13	\$0.17 \$0.31		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Taco Shell Hard, WG, 1 grain per shell	each shell must be 25 g or .9 oz to equal 1 grain	Case 8/25ct	511	\$11.97	\$0.06	\$11.02	\$0.06	\$14.76	\$0.07	\$11.76	\$0.06		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Tortilla WG 6"	at least 25 g or .9 oz of WG	Case, 24/12ct	4	\$22.94	\$0.08	\$10.26	\$0.07	\$22.38	\$0.08	\$19.53	\$0.07		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cinnamon Roll raw dough WG 1 Grain	Readi Bake 11610	Case, 260/1.7oz	180	\$34.35	\$0.14	\$36.41	\$0.15	\$39.90	\$0.15	\$37.83	\$0.15		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Dough Pizza balls (classes)		Case, 180	14	\$31.92	\$0.21	\$27.21	\$0.14	No Bid	\$0.26	\$24.75	\$0.14		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Hush Puppies Swt Corn WG 1 grain	Savannah Classics #10020	Case 2/5# (87 serving ct.)	66	NO BID	\$2.61	\$17.96	\$1.63	\$20.92	\$2.09	\$18.90	\$1.89		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cinnamon Swirl WG	Sky Blue or Gen. Mills	Case 160/1oz	321	\$30.18	\$0.42	\$31.90	\$0.20	\$34.26	\$0.21	\$29.95	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Filled crescent rolls, Choc. WG, 2 grains IW			200	\$29.21	\$0.41	\$29.45	\$0.41	\$30.06	\$0.42	\$29.35	\$0.41		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Filled crescent rolls, grape jelly WG, 2 grains IW			200	\$29.21	\$0.41	\$29.45	\$0.41	\$30.06	\$0.42	\$29.35	\$0.41		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cinnamon rolls mini pull apart IW WG 2 grain		Specify case size and count	300	\$29.58	\$0.41	\$28.72	\$0.40	\$28.82	\$0.40	\$29.35	\$0.41		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Muffin Apple Cinn WG 1 grain	Otis	Case, 72/2oz	159	\$22.19	\$0.31	\$21.55	\$0.30	\$23.13	\$0.32	\$23.20	\$0.32		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Muffin Banana WG 1 grain	Otis	Case, 72/2oz	404	\$22.19	\$0.31	\$21.55	\$0.30	\$21.15	\$0.29	\$38.78	\$0.40		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Muffin Blueberry WG 1 grain	Otis	Case, 72/2oz	611	\$22.19	\$0.31	\$21.55	\$0.30	\$20.62	\$0.29	\$23.20	\$0.32		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Muffin Choc Choc Chip WG 1 grain	Otis	Case, 72/2oz	1631	\$22.19	\$0.31	\$21.55	\$0.30	\$21.48	\$0.30	\$23.20	\$0.32		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Pretzel WG Soft 1 grain each pretzel lt. salt	J&J	Case 100/2.2oz	83	\$20.36	\$0.20	\$50.01	\$0.42	\$22.32	\$0.22	\$18.82	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Roll Dinner WG	Baked for Schools	192/1 oz	613	\$25.71	\$0.16	\$24.71	\$0.06	\$21.42	\$0.11	\$20.64	\$0.11		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Stuffing sage and onion WG pre-cooked heat and serve tray packs, low fat, low sodium				NO BID	\$3.21	\$41.54	\$2.57	No Bid	\$3.21	\$23.99	\$1.71		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Waffle Jumbo WG 1 Grain, bulk	tastes good and crisps in a convection	Case 144/1.2oz	960	\$21.56	\$0.15	\$19.83	\$0.14	\$15.44	\$0.11	\$18.60	\$0.13		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Pancakes, WG 1 Grain bulk	tastes good	Case 144/1 oz eq.	500	\$15.76	\$0.11	\$17.73	\$0.12	\$15.49	\$0.11	\$17.70	\$0.12		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
<b>Total grains</b>					\$14.50		\$12.19		\$13.63		\$11.85		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
<b>Dry Cereals Description</b>	<b>Currently Using All dry cereals must be in individual bowl packs as a WG 1 oz grain eq. reduced sugar that is smart snack compliant</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>												
Cereal Apple Cinnamon Oat Cereal	Kelloggs	Case 96/1oz	319	\$21.09	\$0.22	\$18.78	\$0.20	\$21.10	\$0.22	\$21.03	\$0.22		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Cinn Toast	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1oz	1509	\$18.40	\$0.19	\$19.30	\$0.20	\$17.57	\$0.18	\$18.66	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Cocoa Puffed	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1oz	720	\$18.40	\$0.19	\$20.01	\$0.21	\$17.93	\$0.19	\$18.66	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Fruit O's	Kelloggs	Case 96/1oz	380	\$21.09	\$0.22	\$18.80	\$0.20	\$21.10	\$0.22	\$21.03	\$0.22		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Frosted Flake	Kelloggs	Case 96/1oz	279	\$21.09	\$0.22	\$20.96	\$0.22	\$22.35	\$0.23	\$21.03	\$0.22		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Fruity Oat cereal	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1oz	157	\$18.40	\$0.19	\$24.49	\$0.26	\$20.44	\$0.21	\$18.66	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Cin. Graham	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1oz	199	\$18.40	\$0.19	\$20.01	\$0.21	\$20.44	\$0.21	\$18.66	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Hny Nut Oat cereal	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1oz	394	\$18.40	\$0.19	\$20.01	\$0.21	\$18.43	\$0.19	\$18.66	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Rice Chex gluten free	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1oz	74	\$18.40	\$0.19	\$19.72	\$0.21	\$20.44	\$0.21	\$18.66	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal corn fruit flavored	Gen. Mills Trix	Case 96/1oz	351	\$18.40	\$0.19	\$20.01	\$0.21	\$18.43	\$0.19	\$18.66	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
<b>Total Cereals</b>					\$2.00		\$2.11		\$2.06		\$2.02			
<b>Crackers Description</b>	<b>Currently Using All crackers must be smart snack compliant, individually wrapped (IW) Whole Grain (WG), ≤ Na.+ &amp; 200 cal. In kid friendly shapes</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>												
Cracker cracker shapes WG, IW package 1 grain	Keebler bug bites	Case 210/1oz	410	\$40.84	\$0.19	\$39.88	\$0.19	\$40.48	\$0.19	\$40.12	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cracker Grhm Choc shapes WG, IW package, 1 grain	Keebler Elf grahams & skeeter	Case 150/1oz	426	\$28.30	\$0.19	\$26.13	\$0.17	\$28.59	\$0.19	\$28.04	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cracker Grhm Cinn WG, shapes IW package, 1 grain	Keebler Elf grahams & skeeter	Case 150/1oz	143	\$28.78	\$0.19	\$26.22	\$0.17	\$30.60	\$0.20	\$28.04	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cracker Grhm shapes WG, IW package, 1 grain	Keebler	Case 150/1oz	170	\$29.72	\$0.30	\$24.68	\$0.16	\$40.92	\$0.19	\$28.04	\$0.19		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cracker WG cheese cracker	Sunshine	Case 175/-.75oz	133	\$31.68	\$0.18	\$33.21	\$0.19	\$32.55	\$0.19	\$31.20	\$0.18		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Crackers Animal WG		Case 150/1 oz	384	\$24.00	\$0.16	\$33.89	\$0.17	\$23.62	\$0.16	\$24.00	\$0.16		#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!

Cinnamon Waves WG	Whole Earth	200 ct. case	259	NO BID	\$0.30	\$45.36	\$0.23	\$47.01	\$0.24	\$43.50	\$0.22	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!	
Cracker Wheat Savory														
Bite WG 1 grain min.	MJM	Case 100/2 oz	123	NO BID	\$3.04	\$29.15	\$2.43	\$31.77	\$0.32	\$28.40	\$0.28	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!	
<b>Total Crackers</b>					\$4.55		\$3.72		\$1.68		\$1.59			
<b>Breakfast &amp; Cereal Bars Description</b>	<b>All cereal bars must be IW packs as a WG 1 oz grain eq. minimum, reduced sugar and smart snack compliant</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>												
Estimate Usage														
Granola Bar BS Chewy nut free and processed in a nut free plant WG	Quaker	Case 125/1.2oz	54		\$31.61	\$0.26	\$24.47	\$0.20	\$40.80	\$0.28	\$23.20	\$0.19	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Oatmeal Bar Choc Chip chewy nut free and processed in a nut free plant WG	Quaker	Case 144/1.2oz	23		\$40.29	\$0.28	\$39.39	\$0.27	\$40.80	\$0.28	\$40.16	\$0.28	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Oatmeal Bar chewy nut nut free and processed in a nut free plant	Quaker	Case 144/1.2oz	30		\$40.29	\$0.28	\$39.39	\$0.27	\$40.80	\$0.28	\$40.06	\$0.28	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Double Choc														
Oatmeal bars, butter scotch, double choc. Other assort flavors WG 1 grain					\$40.29	\$0.28	\$40.11	\$0.28	No Bid	\$0.35	\$40.06	\$0.28		
Oatmeal Bites Choc Chip IW, WG, low sugar	Gen. Mills prefer nut free and nut free plant	Case 36/1.24 oz	20		\$14.28	\$0.40	\$43.89	\$1.22	\$17.77	\$0.49	\$14.92	\$0.41	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Donut Ring yeast WG, 2 grains un-glazed	Riches	Case 84/2 oz	260		\$29.11	\$0.35	\$29.02	\$0.35	\$29.02	\$0.35	\$29.28	\$0.35	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Donut Hole Pwdr IW, 1 grain	Super Bakery Goody	Case 160/1.3 oz	37		\$37.35	\$0.52	\$27.32	\$0.06	\$35.17	\$0.22	\$31.20	\$0.20	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Donut WG, IW, glazed, 2 grains	Super Bakery Goody	Case 80/2.5 oz	169		\$38.62	\$0.54	\$27.78	\$0.35	\$31.67	\$0.40	\$27.48	\$0.34	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Glaze Donut Dip	Riches 14839	Case 24#	113	NO BID		\$2.03	\$39.08	\$1.53	\$38.96	\$1.62	\$38.53	\$1.61	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Bar Cinn Toast	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1.42oz	51		\$26.19	\$0.27	\$27.54	\$0.29	\$27.02	\$0.28	\$26.34	\$0.27	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Bar Cocoa Puff	Gen. Mills	Case 96/1.42oz	74		\$26.19	\$0.27	\$26.39	\$0.27	\$26.98	\$0.28	\$26.34	\$0.27	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Bar Apple filled	Kelloggs Nutrigrain	Case 96/1.55oz	140		\$22.08	\$0.46	\$30.57	\$0.32	\$21.87	\$0.46	\$28.94	\$0.30	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Bar Blueberry filled	Kelloggs Nutrigrain	Case 96/1.55oz	123		\$29.06	\$0.30	\$30.57	\$0.32	\$31.61	\$0.33	\$28.94	\$0.30	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cereal Bar Strawberry filled	Kelloggs Nutrigrain	Case 96/1.55oz	1069		\$29.06	\$0.30	\$31.37	\$0.33	\$28.79	\$0.30	\$28.94	\$0.30	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Breakfast pastry cinnamon single pack WG	Kelloggs Pop Tart	Case 12/10ct	29		\$36.29	\$0.30	\$35.78	\$0.30	\$38.46	\$0.32	\$35.94	\$0.30	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Breakfast pastry Strawberry single pack WG	Kelloggs Pop Tart	Case 12/10ct	30		\$36.29	\$0.30	\$34.11	\$0.28	\$37.85	\$0.32	\$35.94	\$0.30	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Chocolate chip waffer cracker WG 1 grain	Nature Valley		300		\$34.44	\$0.29	\$45.06	\$0.38	\$35.16	\$0.29	\$34.15	\$0.28	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cinnamon Waffer cracker WG 1 grain	Nature Valley		300		\$34.44	\$0.29	\$45.06	\$0.38	\$35.16	\$0.29	\$34.15	\$0.28	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Egg Cheese Turkey Bacon Toast WG, 1 grain, 1 Meat eq.	Tasty Brand	Case 120/2.6 oz	360		\$30.18	\$0.42	\$59.49	\$0.50	\$58.73	\$0.49	\$58.77	\$0.49	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
French Toast Cinnamon WG, IW, 1.5 grain, 1 meat	Sunny Fresh	Case 120/2.6 oz	207		\$66.26	\$0.46	\$48.18	\$0.37	\$48.73	\$0.44	\$45.12	\$0.41	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Egg Colby Cheese Omelet 2 MMA	Sunny Fresh	Case 225/2 oz	114		\$37.33	\$0.26	\$63.70	\$0.28	\$65.64	\$0.29	\$60.41	\$0.27	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Eggs Hardboiled		Case 16/2 ct.	27		\$23.60	\$0.16	\$24.97	\$0.17	\$12.86	\$0.39	\$10.09	\$0.32	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Taco Egg & Chs 1 MMA, 1 grain	El Monterey	Case, 50/2.5oz	170		\$22.20	\$0.44	\$47.36	\$0.49	\$24.88	\$0.50	\$21.47	\$0.43	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Yogurt 4-5# Bulk low fat, low sodium, smart snack compliant	Upstate	Case 4/5#	13		\$19.77	\$19.77	\$26.92	\$26.92	\$24.72	\$24.72	\$19.84	\$19.84	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Yogurt Cherry low fat, low sodium, smart snack compliant	Trix	Case 48/4oz	510		\$11.98	\$0.25	\$12.32	\$0.26	\$12.89	\$0.27	\$12.16	\$0.25	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Yogurt Raspberry low fat, low sodium, smart snack compliant	Trix	Case 48/4oz	319		\$11.98	\$0.25	\$12.32	\$0.26	\$13.26	\$0.28	\$12.16	\$0.25	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Yogurt Strawberry Ban low fat, low sodium, smart snack compliant	Trix	Case 48/4oz	694		\$11.98	\$0.25	\$12.32	\$0.26	\$12.76	\$0.27	\$12.16	\$0.25	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
<b>Total Breakfast</b>						\$29.99		\$36.89		\$34.79		\$29.07		
<b>Condiments &amp; Dressing Description</b>	<b>Prefer sauces with no high fructose corn syrup or red dye #40</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>											#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Estimate Usage														
Hot Sauce buffalo flavor	Franks	Gallon	40		\$37.96	\$9.49	\$30.38	\$15.19	\$48.87	\$12.22	\$45.72	\$11.43	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Teriyaki Sauce low sodium, no MSG, no artificial flavors, no HFCC		6/4.9# bottles	100		\$42.59	\$42.59	\$42.00	\$42.00	\$63.77	\$63.77	\$43.60	\$43.60	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Orange sauce, low sodium, no HFCS, no artificial flavors, no MSG		6/4.9# bottles	100	disqualified has HFCS	\$39.45	\$109.71	\$28.84	\$109.71	\$83.77	\$83.77	\$72.60	\$72.60	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Ketchup 20oz bottle prefer no high fructose corn syrup or red dye #40	Red Gold, Heinz, Grade A	Case, 12/20 oz	4		\$24.56	\$0.11	\$23.44	\$0.04	\$20.69	\$0.07	\$55.72	\$0.09	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Ketchup Sriracha	Red Gold, Heinz, Grade A	Case 12/20 oz.	23		\$11.83	\$0.14	\$21.64	\$0.09	\$21.57	\$0.06	\$20.28	\$0.09	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Margarine Liquid, no trans fat	by lb	Container 17.5	166		\$26.45	\$0.76	\$25.86	\$0.74	\$24.62	\$0.70	\$39.44	\$1.20	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Margarine Solid, no tran fat	by lb	Case 30/1#	161		\$22.49	\$0.75	\$21.23	\$0.71	\$27.58	\$0.92	\$19.98	\$0.67	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Juice Lime bottled	Real	Case 12/15 oz	6		\$11.28	\$0.06	\$39.94	\$0.08	\$41.92	\$0.02	\$19.98	\$0.12	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Sour Cream PC	Daisy	Case 100/1oz	531		\$10.20	\$0.10	\$10.96	\$0.11	\$11.31	\$0.11	\$10.16	\$0.10	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
BBQ Sauce	Trail Blazer 15010	Case 4/1gal	271		\$21.69	\$4.25	\$27.02	\$6.76	\$22.92	\$5.73	\$30.26	\$7.57	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Ketchup prefer no high fructose corn syrup or red dye #40 Canned NOI	Heinz or Red Gold	Case 6/#10	490		\$20.12	\$0.06	\$21.74	\$0.04	\$19.82	\$0.03	\$20.73	\$0.04	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Ketchup Dispenser Refill	Heinz	Case 2/1.5gal	120		\$16.07	\$0.04	\$19.36	\$0.05	\$20.57	\$0.05	\$19.16	\$0.05	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Ketchup PC prefer no high fructose corn syrup or red dye #40 Canned NOI	Heinz or Red Gold	Case 1000ct	93		\$15.95	\$0.02	\$17.69	\$0.02	\$18.50	\$0.02	\$15.73	\$0.02	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Mayo Fat free PC		Case 200/12gm	186		\$21.76	\$0.11	\$8.99	\$0.04	\$12.11	\$0.06	\$9.41	\$0.05	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Mustard PC		Case 500/4.5gm	97		\$8.82	\$0.02	\$6.97	\$0.01	\$9.95	\$0.02	\$4.97	\$0.01	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Dressing Honey Must PC	Ottis	Case, 100/1.5oz	25		\$15.53	\$0.16	\$14.88	\$0.16	\$15.63	\$0.16	\$10.10	\$0.10	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Dressing Honey Must	Ottis	Case 4/1gal	113		\$36.75	\$9.19	\$35.55	\$8.89	\$38.41	\$9.60	\$32.75	\$8.19	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Dressing Ranch Lt 1oz PC		Case 100/1oz	100		\$25.60	\$0.16	\$15.20	\$0.16	\$20.48	\$0.10	\$10.95	\$0.11	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Drsg RC Ranch Low sodium NOI	Mrs. Clarks	Case 4/1gal	350		\$35.49	\$8.87	\$35.45	\$8.86	\$24.76	\$6.19	\$24.75	\$6.19	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Drsg PC Ranch Gluten free 100ct		Case, 100ct 1.5oz	126		\$17.65	\$0.21	\$44.84	\$0.44	\$14.93	\$0.25	\$17.20	\$0.17	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Drsg Caesar		4/1 Gallon	1		\$38.29	\$9.57	\$57.49	\$14.37	\$38.41	\$9.60	\$35.56	\$8.89	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Drsg PC Caesar		Case 60/1.5oz	147		\$19.30	\$0.23	\$16.78	\$0.28	\$13.65	\$0.23	\$11.85	\$0.20	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Drsg FF Italian		Case 4/1gal	65		\$17.19	\$4.30	\$30.46	\$7.62	\$23.36	\$5.84	\$17.42	\$4.36	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Salad Drsg RC Italian		Case 4/1gal	7	Wrong Spec.	\$7.24	\$12.10	\$38.70	\$9.68	\$32.19	\$8.05	\$27.32	\$6.83	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Sauce Tarter fat free PC		Case 200/9gm	20		\$11.70	\$0.06	\$6.60	\$0.03	No Bid	\$0.08	\$6.52	\$0.03	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Soy Sauce		Case 4/1gal	3		\$39.56	\$9.89	\$17.70	\$4.42	\$20.44	\$5.11	\$17.25	\$4.31	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Syrup Pancake		Case 4/1gal	267		\$25.92	\$6.48	\$18.68	\$4.67	\$21.89	\$5.47	\$23.25	\$5.81	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
<b>Total Condiments</b>					\$229.42			\$235.17		\$218.23		\$182.82		
<b>Dessert Description</b>	<b>Must be WG and smart snack compliant and student approved</b>	<b>Purchase Unit</b>											#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Estimate Usage														
Cookie Dough Carnival	Bonzer	Case, 168/1.5oz	349		\$36.47	\$0.18	\$18.30	\$0.11	\$19.26	\$0.11	\$19.01	\$0.11	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cookie Dough Choc Chp	Bonzer	Case, 168/1.5oz	297		\$34.24	\$0.17	\$18.30	\$0.11	\$20.51	\$0.12	\$19.01	\$0.11	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
Cookie Dough Double Choc Chip	Bonzer	Case 168/1.5 oz	50		\$40.83	\$0.20	\$18.30	\$0.11	\$21.27	\$0.13	\$19.01	\$0.11	#DIV/0!	#DIV/0!
<b>Total Dessert</b>					\$0.56			\$0.33		\$0.36		\$0.34		







Foil Sandwich Wrap Red	10 3/4" x 14"	Case 4/500 ct.	65	\$60.28	\$0.03	\$71.75	\$0.04	\$67.05	\$0.03	\$78.32	\$0.04	No Bid	\$0.10		#DIV/0!
Foil Sandwich Wrap Yellow	10 3/4" x 14"	Case 4/500 ct	25	\$96.36	\$0.04	\$71.50	\$0.04	\$67.05	\$0.03	\$71.67	\$0.04	No Bid	\$0.10		#DIV/0!
Glove Poly Large		Case 10/100 ct	39	\$59.06	\$59.06	\$11.94	\$11.94	\$23.72	\$23.72	\$4.99	\$4.99	\$34.40	\$34.40		#DIV/0!
Glove Poly Med		Case 10/100 ct	64	\$59.06	\$59.06	\$11.94	\$11.94	\$23.72	\$23.72	\$4.99	\$4.99	\$34.40	\$34.40		#DIV/0!
Glove Pwd Free Lg		Case 10/100 ct	167	\$32.76	\$32.76	\$24.44	\$24.44	\$25.79	\$25.79	\$28.70	\$28.70	\$23.52	\$23.52		#DIV/0!
Glove Pwd Free Med		Case 10/100 ct	140	\$32.76	\$32.76	\$24.44	\$24.44	\$25.79	\$25.79	\$28.70	\$28.70	\$23.41	\$23.41		#DIV/0!
Glove Vinyl Large		Case 10/100 ct	27	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$27.50	\$27.50	\$23.77	\$23.77	\$28.33	\$28.33	\$23.00	\$23.00		#DIV/0!
Glove Vinyl Medium		Case 10/100 ct.	77	\$32.95	\$32.95	\$27.50	\$27.50	\$23.77	\$23.77	\$28.33	\$28.33	\$23.00	\$23.00		#DIV/0!
Hngd 1 Compt 8x8 tray		Case 200 ct.	49	\$14.60	\$0.07	\$16.99	\$0.08	\$42.82	\$0.21	\$15.29	\$0.10	\$15.25	\$0.08		#DIV/0!
Lid 5 oz. dessert		Case 20/50 ct.	3	\$31.44	\$31.44	\$76.51	\$76.51	\$88.15	\$220.38	\$31.22	\$78.05	No Bid	\$275.48		#DIV/0!
Lid Bowl Foam 8 oz.		Case 5/100 ct.	11	\$27.63	\$27.63	\$59.92	\$59.92	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$20.98	\$41.90	No Bid	\$74.90		#DIV/0!
Lid Full Size Steam Table		Case 50 ct.	60	\$20.64	\$20.64	\$20.64	\$20.64	\$31.73	\$31.73	\$19.80	\$19.80	No Bid	\$39.69		#DIV/0!
Lid Half Size Steam Table		Case 100 ct.	7	\$19.34	\$19.34	\$19.46	\$19.46	\$27.75	\$27.75	\$15.80	\$15.80	No Bid	\$34.69		#DIV/0!
Lid Souffle Cup 1 oz		Case 25/100 ct.	6	\$26.21	\$26.21	\$26.56	\$26.56	\$25.16	\$25.16	\$19.55	\$19.55	\$28.76	\$28.76		#DIV/0!
Lid Souffle Cup 3.25oz		Case 20/120 ct.	43	\$31.44	\$31.44	\$26.72	\$26.72	\$40.84	\$40.84	\$28.63	\$28.63	\$43.48	\$43.48		#DIV/0!
Napkin biodegradable and compostable		Case 23/334 ct	250	NO BID	\$35.50	NO BID	\$35.50	\$33.01	\$16.51	\$28.40	\$28.40	No Bid	\$35.50		#DIV/0!
Pan Liner 16x24		Case 1000 ct	237	\$36.13	\$36.13	\$31.96	\$31.96	\$39.76	\$39.76	\$29.75	\$29.75	\$33.81	\$33.81		#DIV/0!
Pan ST Full Size Deep		Case 50 ct.	70	\$55.85	\$55.85	\$48.19	\$48.19	\$58.99	\$58.99	\$34.70	\$34.70	\$35.00	\$35.00		#DIV/0!
Pan ST Full Size Med		Case 50 ct.	13	\$43.51	\$43.51	\$55.34	\$55.34	\$58.20	\$58.20	\$30.95	\$30.95	\$35.50	\$35.50		#DIV/0!
Pan ST Half Size Deep		Case 100 ct	10	\$32.87	\$32.87	\$88.80	\$88.80	\$42.80	\$42.80	\$24.23	\$24.23	\$85.53	\$85.53		#DIV/0!
Plastic Wrap film 12x12 Perf		1 Roll	350	\$18.52	\$0.01	\$15.58	\$0.01	\$12.83	\$0.01	\$10.75	\$0.01	No Bid	\$0.10		#DIV/0!
Plastic Wrap/food service film with slide cutter 18"	18" x 2000'	1 Roll	125	\$15.14	\$15.14	\$16.56	\$16.56	\$15.10	\$7.55	\$12.95	\$12.95	\$18.26	\$18.26		#DIV/0!
Sack Lunch Brown		2/500 ct. Case	279	\$10.54	\$10.54	\$9.59	\$9.59	\$33.15	\$16.58	\$7.33	\$7.33	\$6.70	\$6.70		#DIV/0!
Sack Lunch White		2/500 ct. Case	3	\$12.64	\$12.64	\$12.22	\$12.22	\$40.40	\$20.20	\$8.99	\$8.99	\$8.35	\$8.35		#DIV/0!
Souffle Cup Plastic 1oz		Case 25/200 ct.	7	\$31.03	\$62.06	\$27.09	\$54.18	\$56.53	\$56.53	\$37.15	\$37.15	\$34.00	\$68.00		#DIV/0!
Souffle Cup Plastic 3.25oz heat tolerant		Case 12/200 ct.	49	\$39.50	\$0.02	\$31.26	\$0.01	\$52.38	\$0.02	\$34.68	\$0.01	\$48.10	\$0.02		#DIV/0!
Souffle Cup Plastic 4 oz		Case 12/200 ct	7	\$45.36	\$0.02	\$68.49	\$0.03	\$56.44	\$0.02	\$38.25	\$0.02	No Bid	\$0.10		#DIV/0!
Straws 5 3/4 Slim compostable		to replace plastic option	53	\$49.63	\$4.14	NO BID	\$18.94	\$302.95	\$15.15	\$99.80	\$3.83	\$10.83	\$10.83		#DIV/0!
Straws 5 3/4 Slim		Case 25/500 Ct.	53	\$49.63	\$49.33	\$33.33	\$33.33	\$33.54	\$33.54	\$24.50	\$24.50	\$28.88	\$28.88		#DIV/0!
Tray #300 Gingham		Case 2/250 ct	775	\$15.46	\$15.46	\$13.50	\$13.50	\$18.38	\$18.38	\$14.15	\$14.15	No Bid	\$22.98		#DIV/0!
Tray #300 natural Eco print	to replace gingham bio compostable	Case 2/250 ct	775	\$15.46	\$15.46	\$24.14	\$24.14	\$21.86	\$21.86	\$12.80	\$12.80	\$24.90	\$30.78		#DIV/0!
Tray #40 Gingham		Case 4/250 ct	30	\$14.87	\$14.87	\$20.43	\$20.43	\$17.53	\$17.53	\$11.89	\$11.89	No Bid	\$25.54		#DIV/0!
Tray #40 Natural Eco Print	Compostable to replace gingham	Case 4/250ct	30	\$14.87	\$14.87	\$18.65	\$18.65	\$22.46	\$22.46	\$11.89	\$11.89	No Bid	\$28.08		#DIV/0!
Tray 3 Comp Hinged styro		Case 150 ct.	40	\$17.75	\$0.09	\$19.08	\$0.10	\$17.31	\$0.12	\$12.47	\$0.08	\$16.04	\$0.08		#DIV/0!
Tray 3 Comp Hinged biodegradable and compostable.		Specify case size and count	40	\$17.75	\$0.09	\$33.16	\$0.17	\$26.49	\$0.18	\$58.81	\$0.20	\$41.99	\$0.21		#DIV/0!
Tray 5 Comp biodegradable and compostable screened	Savaday	Case 240 ct	6500	NO BID	\$0.14	\$40.55	\$0.04	\$16.01	\$0.07	\$28.95	\$0.06	\$53.07	\$0.11		#DIV/0!
Wipes White Food Service clothes	Heavy duty, Antimicrobial & Disposable 13"x24" Tork (41072) or similar	Case 150ct	186	\$32.67	\$32.67	\$27.72	\$27.72	\$50.77	\$50.77	\$29.37	\$29.37	No Bid	\$63.46		#DIV/0!
<b>Paper and Supplies Total</b>					\$1,159.58		\$1,290.48		\$1,377.49		\$928.57		\$1,512.86		