

| Item # | Qty | Description | Business Services | | Great Lakes | | Commercial Restaurant | | Douglass Equipment | | Boelter | | Sam Tell | | B & J | |
|--------|-----|--------------------------------|---------------------------------|----------------|-------------|--------------|-----------------------|-----------------|--------------------------|-------------|-------------|--------------|----------------|-----------------|----------------|-----------------|
| | | | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost |
| 1 | 5 | Vendor Merchandising Kiosk | 4859.98 | 24299.9 | 5005 | 25025 | 4541.94 | 22709.7 | Included in total | | 4836 | 24180 | 4301.74 | 21508.7 | 4853.98 | 24269.9 |
| 2 | 6 | Cash Register Stand | 1289.98 | 7739.88 | 1409 | 8454 | 1085.76 | 6514.56 | Included in total | | 1159 | 6954 | 1130.29 | 6781.74 | 1198.4 | 7190.4 |
| 3 | 2 | Victory VR-2 Refrigerator | 2879.98 | 5759.96 | 3800 | 7600 | 2723.76 | 5447.52 | Included in total | | 2829 | 5658 | 2933.28 | 5866.56 | 3269.83 | 6539.66 |
| | 6 | Extra Epoxy Shelves | No Bid | No Bid | 30 | 180 | 27.38 | 164.28 | \$ 157.92 | \$ 947.52 | 28 | 168 | 29.48 | 176.88 | 32.29 | 193.74 |
| | | Total Item 3 | | NA | | 7780 | | 5611.8 | NA | | | 5826 | | 6043.44 | | 6733.4 |
| 4 | 4 | Cambro Food Bar | 1459.98 | 5839.92 | 2579 | 10316 | 1581.84 | 6327.36 | Included in total | | 1691.5 | 6766 | 1969.81 | 7879.24 | 1407.54 | 5630.16 |
| | | Total Item 1,2 & 4 | | 37879.7 | | 43795 | | 35551.62 | | 0 | | 37900 | | 36169.68 | | 37090.46 |
| 5 | 2 | Hatco Buffet Warmer | 1079.98 | 2159.96 | 1432 | 2864 | 1082.64 | 2165.28 | Included in total | | 1671 | 3342 | 973.47 | 1946.94 | 1270.1 | 2540.2 |
| 6 | 1 | Duke Utility Serving Counter | 3799.98 | 3799.98 | 6499 | 6499 | 6078.38 | 6078.38 | Included in total | | 6367 | 6367 | 6906.87 | 6906.87 | 6442.68 | 6442.68 |
| 7 | 1 | Duke Serving Counter Utility | 2219.98 | 2219.98 | 2718 | 2718 | 1926.29 | 1926.29 | Included in total | | 2312 | 2312 | 2204.12 | 2204.12 | 2112.42 | 2112.42 |
| | | Total for 6 & 7 | Does not include install | 6019.96 | | 9217 | | 8004.67 | | 0 | | 8679 | | 9110.99 | | 8555.1 |
| 8 | 2 | Turbo Air Merchandizer | 4719.98 | 9439.96 | 7332 | 14664 | 5125.12 | 10250.24 | Included in total | | 6257 | 12514 | 5942.3 | 11884.6 | 6059.42 | 12118.84 |
| 9 | 1 | Ice Machine | 3179.98 | 3179.98 | 2752 | 2752 | 3533.42 | 3533.42 | Included in total | | 4046 | 4046 | 3329.96 | 3329.96 | 3406.52 | 3406.52 |
| | 1 | Filter | 169.98 | 169.98 | 190 | 190 | 89.44 | 89.44 | \$ 168.44 | \$ 168.44 | 174 | 174 | 179.36 | 179.36 | 157.43 | 157.43 |
| | | Total Item 9 | | 3349.96 | | 2942 | | 3622.86 | | NA | | 4220 | | 3509.32 | | 3563.95 |
| 10 | 1 | 12 Crate Milk Cooler | 1669.98 | 1669.98 | 2412 | 2412 | 1911.76 | 1911.76 | Included in total | | 2514 | 2514 | 1940.66 | 1940.66 | 1848.81 | 1848.81 |
| 11 | 1 | 6 Gallon Steam Jacketed Kettle | 4699.98 | 4699.98 | 5102 | 5102 | 4371.38 | 4371.38 | Included in total | | 5129 | 5129 | 4846.99 | 4846.99 | 5195.05 | 5195.05 |
| | 1 | Food Strainer | 109.98 | 109.98 | 172 | 172 | 327.08 | 327.08 | \$ 325.60 | \$ 325.60 | 324 | 324 | 188.97 | 188.97 | 345.95 | 345.95 |
| | 1 | Lift Off Cover | 309.98 | 309.98 | 206 | 206 | 282.88 | 282.88 | \$ 281.60 | \$ 281.60 | 281 | 281 | 226.76 | 226.76 | 299.2 | 299.2 |
| | 1 | Stainless Steel Stand | 1469.98 | 1469.98 | 1801 | 1801 | 1869.68 | 1869.68 | \$ 1,861.20 | \$ 1,861.20 | 1853 | 1853 | 1984.14 | 1984.14 | 937.34 | 937.34 |
| | 1 | Hot and Cold Water Faucet | No Bid | No Bid | 335 | 335 | 349.18 | 349.18 | \$ 347.60 | \$ 347.60 | 346 | 346 | 363.76 | 363.76 | 369.33 | 369.33 |
| | | Total for Item 11 | | NA | | 7616 | | 7200.2 | | NA | | 7933 | | 7610.62 | | 7146.87 |

| Item # | Qty | Description | Culinary Depot | | Stafford-Smith | | Gradys | | Ford | |
|--------|-----|--------------------------------|----------------|-----------------|----------------|-----------------|----------------|-----------------|----------------|-----------------|
| | | | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost | Item Cost | Total Cost |
| 1 | 5 | Vendor Merchandising Kiosk | No Bid | | 4983.61 | 24918.05 | 4598.27 | 22991.35 | 4716.63 | 23583.15 |
| 2 | 6 | Cash Register Stand | No Bid | | 1422.41 | 8534.46 | 1075.32 | 6451.92 | 1127.52 | 6765.12 |
| 3 | 2 | Victory VR-2 Refrigerator | 2587.89 | 5175.78 | 3573.82 | 7147.64 | 2797.57 | 5595.14 | 2639.95 | 5279.9 |
| | 6 | Extra Epoxy Shelves | 23.96 | 143.76 | 29 | 174 | 27.11 | 162.66 | 26.54 | 159.24 |
| | | Total Item 3 | | 5319.54 | | 7321.64 | | 5757.8 | | 5439.14 |
| 4 | 4 | Cambro Food Bar | No Bid | | 1717.68 | 6870.72 | 2279.49 | 9117.96 | 1229.58 | 4918.32 |
| | | Total Item 1,2 & 4 | | 0 | | 40323.23 | | 38561.23 | | 35266.59 |
| 5 | 2 | Hatco Buffet Warmer | 1320.1 | 2640.2 | 1522.05 | 3044.1 | 2286.1 | 4572.2 | 1247.24 | 2494.48 |
| 6 | 1 | Duke Utility Serving Counter | No Bid | | 7169.86 | 7169.86 | 5047.79 | 5047.79 | 6006.98 | 6006.98 |
| 7 | 1 | Duke Serving Counter Utility | No Bid | | 3050.63 | 3050.63 | 1838.94 | 1838.94 | 2177.37 | 2177.37 |
| | | Total for 6 & 7 | | NA | | 10220.49 | | 6886.73 | | 8184.35 |
| 8 | 2 | Turbo Air Merchandizer | 5609.17 | 11218.34 | 7075.47 | 14150.94 | 5860.69 | 11721.38 | 5561.54 | 11123.08 |
| 9 | 1 | Ice Machine | 3440.59 | 3440.59 | 4127.77 | 4127.77 | 3283.35 | 3283.35 | 3283.52 | 3283.52 |
| | 1 | Filter | 175.18 | 175.18 | 186.72 | 186.72 | 168.44 | 168.44 | 181.91 | 181.91 |
| | | Total Item 9 | | 3615.77 | | 4314.49 | | 3451.79 | | 3465.43 |
| 10 | 1 | 12 Crate Milk Cooler | No Bid | | 2677.4 | 2677.4 | 2094.05 | 2094.05 | 1888.69 | 1888.69 |
| 11 | 1 | 6 Gallon Steam Jacketed Kettle | No Bid | | 5770.29 | 5770.29 | 5116.43 | 5116.43 | 4338.77 | 4338.77 |
| | 1 | Food Strainer | No Bid | | 189.53 | 189.53 | 190 | 190 | 185.19 | 185.19 |
| | 1 | Lift Off Cover | No Bid | | 227.43 | 227.43 | 228 | 228 | 222.23 | 222.23 |
| | 1 | Stainless Steel Stand | No Bid | | 1141.89 | 1141.89 | 1197 | 1197 | 1166.72 | 1166.72 |
| | 1 | Hot and Cold Water Faucet | No Bid | | 369.58 | 369.58 | 370.5 | 370.5 | 361.13 | 361.13 |
| | | Total for Item 11 | | NA | | 7698.72 | | 7101.93 | | 6274.04 |
